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The film industry of the r98os reacted ro a major technological ad-
vancement in the entertainment business that orisinated outside of
cinema itself. Video technology and cable disrriburion progressivery
altered overall film consumption, supplying new markets and targeting
at that time a limited but well-secured audience.' The r98os were
characterized by the shift from eclectic independent lilms to more
prolitable commercial films, the beginning of the freneric rise in pro-
duction costs (dividing big productions with remaining national pro-
ductions), and the inreasingly more powerful position of French
television over cinematographic production. From now on, the French
film industry had to consider television ratings, accentuated by the
introduction of TV commercials during the screening of films. More
than ever, the obligation for sound financial profit became the major
criterion in decision making. Consequently, rhe consranr upport de farce
between the big and small screen reined in filmmakers' initiative and
shaped an aesthetic model with a common mold.

It is a daunting task to attempt an overall description of French
cinema of the r98os. Traditional film categories, usually recognized
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by general audiences, began to dissolve by the eady part of the de-
cade, rapidly substituted by a cinema of new young directors. For
pfesent purposes, the decade has been divided into three categories:
experienced directors (Maurice Pialat, Bertrand Taternier, Eric Roh-
mer, Franqois Truffaut, Agnis Varda, Bertrand Blier), new directors
(Jean-Jacques Beineix, Luc Besson, Leos Carax), and big-productron
directots (Claude Berri, Jean-Jacques Annaud). The r98os was also

a determining decade for feminist cinema. More women directots
were represented at 6lm festivals, and more women filmmakefs grad-

uated from French lilm schooLs. This particular trend accelerated in

rhe r99os.
Despite the move toward mote commercial productions, lilm festi-

vals around the wodd, like Cannes, strove to preserve the artistic ideals

of filmmaking. Considered the most important film showcase in the
world, Cannes had long been promoting European coproductions,
Asian films (formerly little known in the S7est), and French New
Vave. N{oreover, it presented to the wodd a different image from the
traditional Oscar iconography. At the end of the r97os, the mission of

Cannes seemingly moved toward the promotion of "courageous pro-

ductions," rewarding films such as the Taviani l:'rothers' Padrc Pa,lrone
(r977), Francis Ford Coppola's Apocalyprc Now (r97Q, Andrzej !(ajda's
Man of lron (r98r), Yilmaz Giiney's )ial(r982), and even \(im !7en-

ders's Paris, Texas (t984).

FRANCE IN THE r98os

Following a twenty-three-year cooservative regime. rhe r98os began
with one of the most extensive political changes in contemporary
French history: the election of socialist Franqois Mitterand to the
presidency on May ro, r98r- It brought the l irst Lefr-coalit ion govern-

ment in some forty-five years, following L€on Blum's ephemeral PoP-

ular Front alliance. Despite the significant liberalization of French

society, which occurred during the Giscard years, from r9i4 to r98r
(the voting age was lowered to eighteen, the enrollment of female
students at the univ€rsity level increased, the decisive Simone Veil Act
legalizing abortion and divorce by common consent passed in 1975),
tbe female and youth vote favored the candidate of the left. The
apparent stability of the French ptesidential regime cleady indicated
that the Fifth Republic's constitutional issues played an essential role
in the political agenda since it was created in 1958. Taking advantage
of an unprecedented movement of national enthusiasm, Mitterrand
promptly dissolved the Assembl6e nationale, and the consequent leg-
islative elections that took place in June confirmed the inclination for
political change, giving a wide majority to the Socialist Party alone
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(269 of the total 49r seats). Mitterrand's ''sovereignry," corroborated
by his successful campaign slogan La fara tranquille, began with a
rush of socialist fervor all over France. Because of rhe Communisr
Party's endorsement before the second round of the election, four
members of that political party were appointed ro rhe cabiner of
Prime Minister Pierre Mauroy (the first time since the Liberation s
coalition government).

With a polirical victory, which evidently appeared to be the vorers'
mandate, Mitterrand gained the confidence to rapidly cary out major
economic and social reforms- (Radical change, horvever, did not occur
in r98r, any more than it did in 1968, as the foundations of French
institutions remained unchanged.) Some of rhe very l irst decisions, for
which the new Sovernment was widely praised among the working-
class population, were the signilicant raise in the minimum I'age (the
minimum wage, called SMIC, rvas raised ro percent in June r98r),
increased social security benefits, increased welfare compensations, a
lifth week of paid vacation, the working week shortened ro rhity-nin.
hours, and the subjecting of layoffs to state control. On the judiciary
side, a hisrorical reorganization rook place under rhe close scruriny of
rhe new administrarion, and in September t98t, Justice Secretary

Joseph Badinter, following a speech of great magnitude before the
French Parliament, led the vote for the abolition of the dearh penalty.
(France was actually rhe last country in the EEC ro ban capiral punish-
ment officially.)

In addition to the polirical rransformations, economic measures de-
hned the future direction of the new government's agenda: a dozen
major industries, national banks, and insurance companies were na-
tionalized within a couple of years; a ban on nuclear resring was
imposed; several projects for the construcrion of nuclear power plants
were deferred; and taxes on the highest social brackets were imple-
mented. In addirion, the government decentralized, giving more power
to the regions. In an effon to create a new dynamic for smaller
companies, a substantial degree of economic delegation shifted part of
the state's authority to regional and local councils. The new organiza-
tion of state cultural interventions played a major role in the daily
l ives ofthe French people. In September r98r, rhe first TGV (high-
speed train) connection between Paris and Lyon was inaugurated. Two
hours was now all the time needed to reach the capital fiom its second
largest metropolis- Consequently, this new technical advance directly
created an intense comperition with French airline companies.

But while the socialist administration was focusing on some gigarr-
tic socioeconomic tasks, the majority of European nations had already
begun the program to counter the European Economic Community's'
most urgent problem at the time, inflation. In France, inflation rose to
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14 percent and unemployment to almost Io percent. By 1982, the
economy had deteriorared in most European countries (an average rz
percent inflation rate), and most governmenrs imposed a controlled
gfowth of wage caps and unpopular price freezes among small busi-
nesses despite ta-t concessions to business. Finance Minister Jacques
Delors indicated that the present economic and social projecrs were
ultimately undermining the national economy. The so-called period of
economic austerity began with the devaluation of the French franc.
Austerity measures were adopted in June r98u and March 1983,
including major cuts in public exp€nses.

The lirst socialist administration came to an end with the legislative
elections in 1986 and the victory ofthe right coalition, which regained
a slim majority in the parliament. This episode was the first time rn
rhe hisrory of rhe Fifth Republic that the majority in the assembly did
not endorse the president's party. The flew government, formed mainly
by center-right democrats (RPR, Rassemblement Pour la R€publique,
and UDF, Union pour la D€mocratie Frangaise), was led by newly
appoinred Prime Minister Jacques Chirac, who began a policy of pri-
vatizing state-owned companies, decreasing income tax rates at the
upper levels, and removing the wealth tax. Allowing the prime min-
ister to conduct domestic matters. Mitterrand focused on internarional
relarions.

Meanwhile, within the turmoil of the so-called cohabitation, a new
political figure emerged on the French political scene. This was Jean-
Marie Le Pen, who headed the National Front Party (Front National),
which scored successes with its xenophobic-themed crusade to expel
illegal or unemployed immigrant workers. The party's platform also
strongly opposed the residency and electoral rights granted to certain
categories of immigrants.

If it was true that social tensions in most large subutban areas
rapidly caused a redefinition of the political debate around the mid-
r98os, it was also apparent that despite the escalation of those con-
flicts, new associations, such as S-O.S. Racisme, were proving the
solidarity and cohesion of French people. Stand-up comedian and film
actor Coluche, followed by a myriad of French artists and celebrities,
created an unprecedenred association-Les Restos du Coeur-which
to date symbolizes the awareness triggered by the spreading of a new
kind ofpoverry in major French urban afeas: /es xaateaux pauuret.

The period of 
''cohabitation" between Chirac and Socialisr president

Mitterrand lasted only a couple of years, until Mitterrand's teelection
on May 8, 1988. Despite rhe facr that a signiFcant segment of the
French population that was profoundly disillusioned wirh the socral
changes and economic reforms (they were often laf:,eIed les tldgus du
socialiynelthe disillusioned ones), against all odds Mitterrand was able
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to r(gain the confidence of the majority. What he had actually pur in
place, years before announcing his candidacy for a second mandate, can
best be described as an understared reverence of the persona, an au-
thentic "cultification" of the (or his own) presidency. Mitterrand's
political career, indeed, extended over half a century, and his fourteen
years as presidenr of the French Republic made him France's longest
reigning politician since Napol6on III.r However, despite the social
reforms and historical decisions, the socialist administration's expert-
ence never quite succeeded in transforming French society's fundamen-
tal nucleus, capitalistic structule, or social profile.o

In France, the r98os began with an assettive new cultural trend
clearly delined as "cultural pluralism." One of the best examples of the
new consensus occuned on March 6, r98o, as writer Marguetite Your-
cenar became the lirst woman to enter the highly select society of the
Acaddmie franEaise. In the freld of popular music, the r98os was
marked by the rediscovery of cosmopolitan afiists, particulady African
aftists (e.g., Tour6 Kounda, Manu di Bango, and Mori Kanre), this
rime not exclusively by connoisseurs, but by large and diverse popular
audiences. In the field of radio entertainment, and befote rhe advent of
video, there were new horizons for radio broadcast wirh the legaiization
ofprivate and local stations in 1982. A multitude ofnew radio statrons
surfaced, along wirh raditional public radio stations on FM. Musrc
srations, such as the newly created NRJ, Fun Radio, and Skyrock, were
immediately popular among young audiences. The novelty led ro the
long-awaited reorganization of the radio networks. Unfortunately, the
hope of seeing small radio stations linally emerge following decades of
negation and sequestrarions was squashed as the largest private radio
companies (e.g., NRJ) promoted themselves as the new and exclusive
leaders for young audiences. Created in r98 r by Jean-Paul Baudecroux,
NRJ reached an audience between frfteen and thirty years of age. Vith
its strong public relations strategy and organization of concerts in
France, the company rapidly created a large network of provincial radio
stations throughout the country.5

Outside the traditional fields of entertainment (music and cinema),
France of rhe r98os represented a new era for individual well-being.
As the American trend for jogging invaded Europe and France, the
French gradually developed a new awareness of physical firness. In
sports, France, one of the few westetn nations hitherto never to wrn
any international title in team sports, came away with its lirst in June
1984: a victory in the Eutopean soccer championship. On water, G6r-
ard d'Aboville was rhe firsr man ro row across the Atlantic Ocean, and
in space, astronaur Jean-Loup Chr6tien was the firsr Frenchman to
participate in an international space explotarion ptoject, spending
seven days in rhe company of Soviet cosmonauts on Sa1az T6 it 1982.

TRENCH Clr\*EMA
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This success was echoed by another technological sensation. First
launched in September 1982, Ariane began a long string of successful
commercial contracts in rhe satellite market. In rhe field ofarchitecture
and national construction, the r98os proved an exceptionally prolific
period under the turelage of President Mitterrand, whose decisions for
the most part triggered fierce opposition from political adversaries and
urban representatives, and as the years wenr by ultimately brought
about a national reconciliation. Since Baron Georges Haussmann's
architectural enterprises a century before, Paris had never undergofle
such exrensive construction and architectural develoFment. The follow-
ing achievements asserted French cultural leadership by adorning Paris
with a glirtering collection of cultural monuments that included the
Op6ra Bastille (1989), L M. Pei's pyramid of the louvre (inaugurated
in r988), the Grand Louvre (r989), the new National Library (1995),

a science and technology complex at La Villerte (r985), and the gigan-
tic Arche de la D6fense (1989), making a spectacular visual and linear
alignment with the Arc de Triomphe, the Champs-Elys6es, the Tuil-
eries, and the Louvre.

For cinema, as well as rhe arts in general, rhe nomination ofJack
Lang as the new minister of culture within the socialist government
would be of considerable irnportance for the test of the century. Vith
his nomination, the status of the Ministre de la Culture, tradirionally
secondary, even unknown at times, sudden.ly became the cultural win-
dow of a new narion in a new decade, and Lang served as the spokes-
man for the new political disposition. During the two socialist
mandates, Lang was the only member of the government ro be twice
appointed to his posirion (r98r 86 and t988 93). Specacular cultural
manifestations, combined wirh a great communicative savoir faire, best
define Lang's gift for popular aFpearances. Lang's agenda began rm-
mediately with a coup de th66tre, which occurred via his declaratrons
toward Deauville's American Film Festival. Lang, who refused to at-
tend the event, made several rematks emphasizing the desire for eco-
nomic independence of French cinema from what was again perceived
as American-cultural hegemony, which, according to observers at the
time, was interpreted as outspoken anti-Americanism.

Despite some difficult episodes like the r98r closing of the legen-
dary Victorine Studios in Nice, French cinema was in part assisted by
several encouraging iniriatives, such as the foundation of the Lumidre
Institute in Lyoo (1982), the inauguration of the llamboyant Palais
des Festivals in Cannes (1983) to replace the old movie theater by
rhen too small for rhe annual event, and the inauguration of the 6rst
annual French Film Festival in Sarasota, Florida (1989). And while
Lang's popularity never wavered, particularly after organizing the first
annual F€te de la musique in 1982, as well as the F€te du cin6ma,
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the beginning of the r98os was synonymous rvith growing economtc
difficulties and with the dramatic and sudden increase in production
costs in French cinema. As a result, Lang decided to create eight
regional cinema centers (Grenob.le, Nantes, Quimper, le Havre, Bo-
bigny, Vitrolles, Villemur-sur-Tarn, and Nantetre), known as mauons
de la cu/ture, all financed by the state. Despite the srrong commitment
of the government, however, regional cinema never took off commer-
cially, and Paris continued to be, and still remains, the only generator
of full-length features and new filmmakers.

FRINCH CINEMA OF THE r98os: OVER ONE
THOUSAND FILMS PRODUCED

Compared to the preceding decade, which valued a certain type of
militant cinema representative of the spirir of the time, French cinema
of the r98os could in retrospect be described as the era of the "neo-
polar." Akhough still inspired by the New \7ave, French directors
insrigated an eloquent return to more rraditional storytelling remtnrs-
cent of the posrwar era. If a dependable and critical debate on the war
in Algeria was absent during the early r96os (as well as the militant
spirit of the post-'68 era), this new decade suggesred a rvide variety of
different aesthetic styles and theories just as if each director claimed
his or her own school or folitique. Inventive fictions juxtaposed with
aesthetic chronicles and spirituality took ovet (e.g., Alain Cavalier's
Thlrise, 1286, earned six C6sar awards). One of the many reasons why
political and militant cinema productions began to slow down at the
end of the r97os, and clearly during the first couple of years of the
r98os, was the shift of power to the new socialist administration.
Many filmmakers, adherent to socialist political ideas, mosr likely did
not feel a need to pursue a mote politically engaged cinema while no
longer in a position of opposition. Except in rare cases, most political
films did not represent contemporary French society. Film historian
Susan Hayward explains the reason for the trend:

The primary reason for this evaporation of authenticity in cinema was
tied in with the overall meaning of disaffecrion s,ith ideology. \fhen
the Left came to power in r98r, they did so on a platform of social
reforms. The Lefr's discourse was embedded with the rhetoric of social
justice and as such rvas far removed from the politics of liberalism that
had so valued capitalism, free-marketing ideology, and implicitly, the
individual. In simple terms the socialist platform amounted to a credo
in sociecy. But by 1982 €3 and to the electorate's mind ac least-
this credo, because of the effects of recession, had all but evaporated,
and to all appearances the Left was instituting policies that did little to
distinguish it from the Right. It is in the centering of these discoutses

FRENCH CINEM-{



The Cinema of tbe r98os l o t

that one can perceive the evaporation of authenric cinema. As with the
political arena, the r98os witnessed a centering of cinema's ideological
discourses from the "left-Marxisr-iofl ected" aod "anti-American heee-
monic pmxis" 6lms of the r96os and r97os, from a politrcal .inema
that was politically made to an apolitical cinema that was designet and
consumer led- rVith rare exceptioos, the cinema of the r98os and earll'
r99os has been one that says "since there is nothing here (no ideology,
etc.). let's imitate."6

With the decline of political lilms in the r98os, contemporary social
observation was less likely ro be found in the subject matter of ne$,,
filmmakers. On an economic level, the linancial aid commitrees cleady
would not approve of a militant cinema. Therefore, it is true that soon
after the beginning of the Mitterrand years, political cinema, as well
as the subject of politics in films, rapidly disappeared, with rare excep-
tions.T Unlike the artistic trend of the preceding decade, French cin-
ema of the r98os never quite seemed to reflect the spirit of its trme.
The reason for this was most likely a combinarion of the growing
economic and humanitarian crises and difficuhies, the catasrrophe of
Chernobyl, the outbreak of AIDS, the eruption of a new type of urban
poverty, and rhe never-ending growth of unemployment. If the decade
began with the people's visible aspiration ro social change, the r98os
certainly ended with a sky full of clouds over French society in general.
"In the r98os," observes Hayward, "the authentic cinema evaporated
in the face of pastiche,"3 and ir was no surprise to perceive the decline
of original auteur cinema. Although in financially dire straits, French
ci dna d'autekfi nevertheless was still present in the r98os, but in a
large part in productions that never feached an audience and re-
mained withour disuibution. The celebrated cindpbiles' cinema was
going through a difficult period. One of the most dmmatic aftermaths
of the ruthless competition between television and the seventh art
was, paradoxically, the declining importance of the qaalitd cinema.
Television productions, although lacking technical mastery and cred-
ibility, step by step gained popularity among general audiences and
evenrually secured access to a much rvider spectatorship. For the
French television industry, mass viewership was the number one pre-
occupation, whereas for the French film industry, the notion of the
art of frlm continued to supersede the importance of financial viability
and audience fulfillment.

For the audiences ofthe r98os, mainly by then television spectators,
the star system began to change. Actors were no longer "movie stars"
as in the past. \fith all the festivals, press conferences, promotional
tours, TV talk shows, and magazines, French actors such as G€rard
Depatdieu, Catherine Deneuve, Natha.lie Baye, Richard Berry, and
Isabelle Adjani no longer embodied the hero or cult figure o[ their
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predecessors. Consequently, the devaluation of thei mtdiatique inages
became unavoidable.n

TRANSFORMATIONS IN THE FRINCH FILM
INDUSTRY

The debate over Hollywood hegemony versus French cinema cotte-
sponds to a general debate in France and throughout Europe regarding
the growing supremacy of American culture. The main point of con-
tention is the American system of mass production, as defined by most
major US studios. Taking into considetation the higher cost effectrve-
ness of the typical American production, the central point ofrhe debate
is whether to accept the system or to seek salutary alternarives. Al-
though the issues around this old economic predicament were mostly
a French concetn in the 6rst half of the century, it progressively
became a European mamer during the postwar era. Already suggested
on many occasions by government officials as eady as 1945 (Blum-

Byrnes Agreements), the actual iniriative to build up a European
substitute for the Hollywood production sysrem only began to take
shape under the patronage ofJack Lang. In the end, the r98os repre-
sented the realization of a distinct European production system.

Lang's endeavors were oriented toward preserving the identity of
French cinema (and indirectly the European 61m indusrry in genera.l)
and making it prosper financially, despite the overpowering volume of
American films and the menace of GATT (General Agreement on
Tariffs and Trade) on the international lilm industry.'" To protect the
French film industry from foreign competition, the government reas-
serted the doctrine of protectionism for national productions, vra a
complex set of quoras and state subventions. Logically, the best and
most efficient way to accomplish preset goals, and to protect European
cinema, was to encourage better and more pfoductions. By persuading
other European governments that quality cinematographic producrions
could also help reassert European economic and cultural authority,
Lang indirectly implemented a rebirrh in most European nations'
efforts to subsidize their national lilm productions. Meanrvhile, en-
dowed with essentially worldwide comprehensible narratives and char-
acrers, American films quickly progressed within the European matket,
reaching fifty-six percent of the lilms shown in French movie theaters
and over seventy percent in European movie theaters by r99o. Al-
rhough incessantly providing leading new talent (film direcrors, actors,
and technicians) with cutting-edge artistic scope, the French-film rn-
dustry, in comparison to Holll.wood's, was never able to sustain the
necessary financial commitment and backing. As long as leading
French frlmmakers and critics firmly believed in cinema as an art form
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rather rhafl popular entertainment, the gap between the US and French
6lm industries widened each year. From the first generations of the
postwar era until the r98os, ending with the GAfi in 1993, Holly-
wood expanded the "commerciability" of films. In conttast, the French
system maintained the sacrosanct idea of cindna d auteurr and the highly
protected artisric prerogative of irs filmmakers.

In 1978, producrion costs began to increase dramatically (by seven-
teen percent in just one year) and rose by 35 percenr in 1988." This
increase represenred an attempt to keep up wirh the overwhelming
pace of Hollywood. As a result, many successful actors (e.g., Alain
Delon, G6rard Depardieu, and Jean-Paul Belmondo) became producers
and were eventually able to survive the tide.

Long before production costs increased, however, several French
{ilmmakers and producers understood that in order to keep up with
American turnout, French cinema had to join forces with other na-
tional cinemas. For many, due to new technologies (e.g., satellites and
cable access), which internationalized by force the paysage atdio-t'isuel,
the key was no Ionger ro protect national borders but rather to think
in terms ofa real and efficient European policy (if not global economy).
As a result, 1989 became the firsr year in which the majority offeature
films were actually coproductions. The project was all the more diffi-
cult for Jack I-ang to submit, since most European countries, in similat
fashion to the United States, did not have an authentic representative
for "cultural affairs" in their government. The sudden escalation in
producrion costs ditectly penalized the cindtaa d autears (.more than
doubling during the decade).

Evety stage of production was now to be taken into account: from
the cost of materials (camera, lighting equipment, editing, and studio
time) to the stipends of technical crews rvho, Iess ofren employed,
required higher compensations every year. Because of these financial
difficulties, small-budger producrions slowly began to disappear from
the lilm market. Inspired by the Hollywood model, French producers
began to organize their lilm commercialization no longer around the
frlm itself bur rather rhrough a series of markering products and media
appearances by actors and directors. Visibility in post-production was
by then more than just a commercial necessity. It was a solid guarantee
for a producers'next project. Many French producers, Iike Claude
Berri, reflecting on the reason for the commercial success of American
films in France, came to the conclusion that rhe key component of
prolirable movies was the size of their budget. By the very nature of
their financing, Holly.wood super productions were in a position to
conquer new European markets. Some French producers, less fearful of
financial risk, took up the challenge, giving birth to multinational
giant productions (interestingly enough, gratis mainly American Ii-
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nancing). Eventually, some French filmmakers, in order to secure nec-
essary funding, chose English and English-speaking actors. This was
mainly because most investors, especially distriburors, were American,
and rheir decisions were based on American versions of films. This
gave an edge to those producrions whose language rvas already English,
such as Jean-Jacques Annaud's The Natne tf tbe Rose (l,e nam de Ia rase,
r987) and Luc Besson's Tbe Profexianal (Ldan, 1994).

Meanwhile, the progression of American cinema seemingly continued
to conquer the French market. In r983, French fi lms sti l l  constituted
fifty percent ofthe market, as opposed to thirty-six percent for Amerlcan
films; three years later, in r986, French spectatorship began for the 6rst
time ro shift its preferences in majority for American films (over French
films). The propensiry worsened during the next couple ofyears, and in
1989 French films represented less than forty percent of rhe market, in
comparison to lifty-eight percent for American films- This shift, however,
was among regular film viewers and not among the occasional viewers
whose attendance remained relatively stable. But despite the visible de-
cline of its film industry (with an average of r8o million tickets sold
annually in the r97os, going don'n to rz3 mill ion by r994), French crn-
ema, compared to other European national cinemas, was still one of the
best represented in its national market, with 34 percent in r993-

A new phenomenon began to surface with the concenaration of
commercial successes in the Ftench 6lm market. In the r97os, the
most impoftant commercial successes generally represented twenty
percent of the market. But with the influence of Hollywood, French
film viewing began to diversify, and big commercial productions grew
to fifty percent of the markets. Especially among young audiences,
American motion pictures became more and more popular, often per-
ceived as more entertaining and more accessible when compared to the
average French productions. ln r98:, French cinema recorded more
than 2oo million spectators; attendance decreased by almost half the
number at the end of the decade. Despite this crisis, because of rts
innovation and pragmatic energy, the French film industry somehow
managed ro limit its losses, especially when compared to counuies like
Italy, where rhe decrease in viewership reached 7o percent.

Momentarily leaving aside comparative assessments of US produc-
tions, the French 1ilm industry remains, ar the beginning of the rwenty-
first century, the most dynamic in Europe, with the largest distribution
network of more than 4,ooo theaters. According to the CNC, the
attendance (in mill ions) at French theaters in the r98os was r79 (r98o),

r89  ( r98r ) ,  2o2 (1982) ,  ry9  ( t983) ,  19r  (1984) ,  r75  (1985) ,  168
(tcs86), t17 Q981), tz5 (r988), rzr (r989), and rzz (r99o).

Finally, despite the growing presence of American films, the French
film industry saw some prolitable results, with productions such as
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Claude Pinoteau's Tbe Paty (l-a lnum: more than four million tickets
sold in r98o), Georges lautner's The Profusional (Le profesitnel; four
mill ion in r98r), G6rard Oury's L'as det as (aln:'ost;.1 mill ion in
r982, with 2.45 mill ion during the first screening week), Jean Becker's
Oae Deadly Sumner (L'{ty' meurtrier, five million in 1983)," Claude
Berrr's Tchao Pantin! (three million in r983), Michel Blanc's Marche )
I'orabre (5 million in 1984), Claude Zrdi's My Neu Partner (Lu ripoux.

5.8 million in 1984), Patrice Leconte's l*: spiciali:ta (five million in
1984), Coline Serrcan's Tbru Mex and a Culle (Trni: bonmet et un
coffin, ten million in 1985), Claude Berti's Jean de FL,rene and A4anan
af tbe Spring (seven million and six million, respectively, in r986), and
Luc Besson's The Big Blae (Le grand bleu, nine million in r988).

In light of growing US competirion, French cinema relied heavily
on the government's leadership and modernism in terms of coordinat-
ing a new system of frnancing national productions. For Jack Lang, the
prevailing perspective of verrical integration (i.e., all phases of cine-
matographic production, from shooting, ro marketing strategies, to
distribution, to television rights), traditionally owned or controlled by
a single investor or group of producers, had to be reorganized in order
to liberare the market from the asphyxiating commercial conditions
being created, which sooner or later would compel rhe French film
industry ro orient rhe very identity of its productions roward the
Hollywood model. To supplement the arance[ ! r tecettet system, Jack
Lang created the SOFtrCA (Soci6t6s de financement des industries ci-
ndmatographiques et audiovisuelles) program in 1985. These invest-
ment companies were mostly created to acquire capital from private
individuals or companies in exchange for fiscal advantages. As a result,
more than fifty films were completed by the early r99os. Contrary to
common belief, the duarue! slrr recettet system was not imFlemented
solely to encourage new talent, but to provide sufllcient financial help
for already accomplished and even notorious filmmakers. Despite its
numerous imperfections, the system was able, since its creation in the
early r96os, to set in motion some of the most imFonant projects of
the decade. Set against royalties from French box office revenues, the
systern directly benelited many other filmmakers and came to the
assistance of some of France's most prestigious artists, such as Claude
Lanzmann (Shoab/Shaab, r984), Agnes Yarda (Yagaboad/Sdns toit xi k)i,
r98t), Robert Bresson (.Mc,ney/L'rilg€nt, 1981), and Alain Resnais
(L'anoar ) mort, r984).

In addition to its patron-of-the-arts image, one of the other objec-
tives of the .a!4ncet s r recettes institution was eventually to reinvigorate
the lilm industry, As such, the regulation stipulared that movie com-
panies benefiting from these incentives (mainly 6lm producers) engage
in all aspects of film activity, including post-production, distribution,
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and establishing studios and cinema houses. On the one hand, French
producers generally argued that companies established under this reg-
ularion were more inclined to conduct distribution activities at the
expense of production and the establishment, and running of studios.
On the other hand, French industry representatives accused these 61m
companies of swamping the local market with American movies. A1-
though the government doubled the budget of rhe al)4ncet r r recette!
system in 1982, and consequently facilitated the first feature lilms of
many young film directors, a number of them were precluded from
pursuing a successful movie career for several reasons. These reasons
included the evolution of the market wirh the rapid escalation of
production costs, the disaffection of a public, more and more oriented
toward the American-star system, and the lack of support of French
television companies which were not always open to endorsing "un-

known" lilms, much less coproducing them- Vhen they would consenr
to panicipate in a production, television companies committed to only
a certain percentage of the project, which often turned out to be a
relatively negligible amount. Compared to their seniors, the main
difficulty young filmmakers had to negotiate was that for the 6rst time
television represented a major obstacle to rhe beginning of a film
career. Many young and talented directots were able to achieve only
one film before disappearing from the movie business.

Unlike the early r96os, when the general public went to movie
theaters to see Jean-Luc Godard's Breatbless or Claude Chabrol's Bitter
Reunion, the same general public twenty years later could choose to
wait several months and view new directors'films at home on the
small screen. One of the major problems for the French film industry
in its effort to ensure a new generation of lilmmakers was the produc-
ers' trust in rhe old-school directors, such as Maurice Pialat, Bertrand
Tavernier, and Frangois Truffaut, Investmenrs were difficult during the
economic crunch of the eady r98os, and investors would usually bet
on sure values rather than venture to endorse unknown projects. As a
result, young direcrors were more or less in the same situation their
seniors faced thirty years before them: only a providential professional
connection could launch their professional careers. Despite the innu-
merat'le obstacles, however, a respectable number of new French direc-
tors were able to achieve a first full-length feature 6lm each year
(berween lifreen and twenty annually).

A NE\i/ PARTNER: TELEVISION

In France, the r98os represented a unique socio-economic phase, essen-
tially dominated by the drastic acceleration in the consumption of
cultural goods. Since its 6rst broadcasts in the early r95os, Ftench
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television had never undergone a major orga .zational transformatron.
The single state-owned channel, ORTF (Office radio-t6l6vision franga-
ise), slowly evolved into several channels without ever changing rts
purpose or mission. As the number of TV channels expanded from
three to six. then later seven. television became the dominant medrum
in the world of images. The year 1984 saw a revolution in French
television with the birth of Canal*, whose mission was to broadcast
recently released lilms. Soon imitared by the creation of two other
private television companies two years later (la 5 and M6), the govern-
ment allowed another major breakthrough wirh the privatization of
the oldest state-orvned channel, TFr. \(ith a total of six channels by
1981 (four of which were private companies), French viewers for the
first time enjoyed a relatively broad choice in television entertainment.
The first and direct vicrim of this expansion was, logically, cinema
production, since both the television and film indusrries were by now,
for better or worse, closely interconnected. Cinema was no longer the
only "image'' distributor around.

The aesrheric requirements and economic realities of French televi-
sion deeply influenced the production of French films during the
r98os. More inclined toward general public and family entertainment,
TV producers gradually moved their expectations toward a more re-
fined aesthetic, emphasizing clear-cut commercial products, closer to
the one of the qualitt eta rather thar' the post-'68 era (deeply embedded
in a political and militant behaviorism no longer in demand among
general audiences). From now on, a substantial part of French cinemat-
ographic production was conceived for TV. This not only affecred rhe
choice of subject matter, but also seriously limited rhe cfeativity of
filmmakers. Many film historians, like Jacques Siclier, argue that the
sudden shift roward more televised filmmaking explains the emer-
gence, or reemergence, of more visually inclined directors, r'ho, for the
most part, came from the wodd of advertising (e,g., Jean-Jacques
Annaud and Luc Besson).

Despite a solid financial situation and increasing profits,'3 due
mainly to healthy advertisement contracts, French television companies
continued to increase their participation in cinema productions and
films rights. The turning point of the evolution of film consumption
occurred in 1985, when for the first time a larger number of movies
were screened on national television than in rhearers (consequently,
American films became ptedominant when compared to French films).
Paradoxical as.it may seem, television cinema-fllms whose rights
were bought by television companies was by far rhe cheapest and
most popular source of programming, since the production costs for a
TV film were usually higher when compared to the purchase of the
fi lm's rights. In addition, American television series, which since the
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late r97os had continued ro overwhelm the European market with low
prices (since already amortized in the US), indirectly slowed down the
production of French TV lilms as well as French TV series. Because of
this, national and European quoras were rapidly established. In r985,
rhe revenue of a lilm screened in theate$ represented twenty-five
percent of the total revenue; in r99o, less rhan twenty percent, with
forty percent from relevision rights, eight percent from videos and
fifteen percent from international sales.

In parallel with television, one of rhe largest society phenomena,
which characterized so well the evolution of the r98os, was a sudden
and revolutionary shift in viewing format, which shaped the economrc
prediction of the cinematographic industry forever: television and
VCRs, borh accessible at home, became the new decisive adjuncts.'a
Born in the r96os, the lirst tentative VCR models from the Sony
Corporation initiated the market with the first affordable VCR in
1969, followed a Gw years later by the expansion of two viewing
devices: the Betamax format by Sony and rhe VHS format by the
Matsushita Corporation. Videocassette recorders gradually became less
exclusive and consequently entered the homes of millions of families.
In tc176, the VHS system was commercialized worldwide but rts
progression was somewhat relatively discreet in France. A rather small
number of people at the time, mainly professional, cleady realized that
this new format was about to revolutionize rhe concept of cin6philie
fqlsvsl-1hs VCR would bring to the homes of millions a medium
that had almost exclusively been presented in commercial houses since
the invention of morion pictures. From the late r97os on, the impor-
tance of video in the entertainment iodustry, as well as in art and
education, grew- The accessibility to films on videocassette further
affected artendance at rhe numerous cixy'-chbs rn France by offering the
public irs own selection of films. Although feared by film producers
and distributors for its potential threat to exhibition profits (the sales
of films on videocassette had increased steadily since the coming of
VCRs, with a jump of 75 percent in r993), rhe video market actually
had the opposite effect: not only did it not dramatically affect atten-
dance at thearers, bur it also signilicantly prolonged the commercial
r ime span o f  mosr  French producr ion : .

The r98os were unquestionably the beginning of an important new
viewing era, with more and more French households owning VCRs:
over 2oo,ooo VCRs in r98o; one mill ion in r98z; three mill ion in
r983; f ive mill ion in 1988; and more than ten mill ion in r99o. This
trend parallels the growth in the number of televised films (over 8oo
feature films in 1986 and close to r,3oo films screened on french
television by the end of the decade). rVith an increasing number of
feature films screened on the six French channels (9r3 films in 1988,
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for example), the number of VCRs continued to grow, allowing view-
ers to record movies at no cost and watch them at their leisure.

The crearion of the first private TV channel, Canal*, broughr a
small revolution in rhe history of French-television viewing and syrn-
bolized the beginning of the end for the state monopoly over the
marketing of images, As early as the first season, the new subscriptron
channel, accessible only with a decoder system, immediately offered
nonconforming competirive programs with one feature lilm per day
(usually screened one calendar year after the release in theaters). This
was a considerable advantage since rhe other national channels had a
three-year interval period, unless they coproduced rhe film (which
meanr a one-year delay). Quickly, Canal* improved its programming
and began to screen films six times in a two-week period. Because of
the creation of free private television channels (La Cinq and TV6), rhe
development of Canal* slowed briefly before taking off again in the
late r98os and early r99os. \7ith such incentives as a record screening
of 3:o films per year, the number of subscribers began to increase
dramatically, from z3o,ooo in 1987 to 3 mill ion in r99o. Another
advantage, which indirectly contributed ro the success of Canal*, was
the gradual implementarion, on other channels, of regular interrup-
rions in films for commercial spots. This phenomenon, absent at
Canal*, not only outraged filmmakers but also attracted new viewers
to the uninterrupted viewing mode offered by the new company.

The r98os also brought an important change in the French lilm
industry regarding financing. In the eady r98os, French televisron
coproduced just over twenty percent of French films and ended the
decade coproducing more than lifty percent. In November 1987,
Canal* signed an agreement with major producing companies, which
indirectly affected the production and distribution nerwork all over
France. Canal* became by far the most active participant, and is still
the major partner for the financing of French feature 61ms (e.g., eighty
percent of French productions benefited from Canal* financial aid in
t993)- Latet on, Canala pledged to use one-fifrh of its commercial
and subscription revenue to finance fullJength feature films, 5o per-
cent of which were to be French productions. This was a daunting task
indeed, since more than a quarrer of the company's budger was allo-
cated to screening copyrights.

THE OLD SCHOOL OF FILMMAKERS: FRANQOIS
TRUFFAUT, BERTRAND TAVERNIER, BERTRAND
BLIER, AND MAURICE PIALAT

Although experienced directors such as Maurice Pialat, Berrrand Tav-
ernier, Bertrand Blier, Eric Rohmer, and Franeois Tru{Iaut were still
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active in the early r98os, they rePresenred their own cinematographic

style. Despite rheir unshakable popularity among general audiences'

they no longer epitomized the "young Seneration'' of filmmakers. The

case of Franqois Truffaut is all the more interesting in that his career,

although often celebrated for its phenomenal beginnings, finished with

one of rhe greatest critical successes in French cinema histoty: The Last

hletra (r98o). The inspiration for the film came to Truffaut via Jean
Marais's memoir on the splendor and pains of the Parisian stage during

\7o d \War II. Vith a script written with Suzanne Schiffman, Truffaur

again appealed to audiences with his muttiple layers He combined a

delicate blend of artistic ambitions, popular storytellinS, and excel-

lence in the cinematographic tradition. The Last Metro was a realisric

contemplarion on the amistic mood during the Nazi Occupation. The

film investigates the dynamics in the relationships between the actors

of a theater company in a climate of anragonism and terror. Truffaut

employed only recognizable significances from the plot's main impli-

cation. As the story unfolds, the emotional element progressively

comes to imply another issue-the power of the artist even when

conlined to silence and isolation.
The double plot narrates the story of the struggles of the theater

during the Occupation and Bernard Granger's 6ght for the French

Resistance. In r94z Lucas Steiner (Heinz Bennent), a stage director rn

the Montmartre district of Paris, takes refuge in the basement of his

own theater to escape the Gesrapo. Before his departure, he has left all

the stage directions as well as the manuscript of his latest p.lay to Jean-
Loup Cottin $ean Poiret), a fellow diremor. His rvife, Marion (Cathe-

rine Deneuve), must persuade rhe French authorities not to close the

theater. Meanwhile, the company hires a new actor, Bernard Granger
(Gdrard Depardieu), A parallel srory evokes the double game played

by Marion and Bernard, who hide their love affair as best they can, as

well as rhe double game rhey play on rhe French censor. Although the

gloomy environment of the theater echoes with the disorder of the

Occupation and the ttacking of the Jews, it also functions as a surrep-
ritious device for solidarity among the stage actors. Through the thea-

ter's ventilation ducts, Lucas is able to continue to direct his play from

a distance. Vhen the police finally come to investigate the building,

Bernard, who has learned that Marion's husband is living in the

basement, decides to help the suuggling couple.
lVith a large box-office profit of 3.3 million tickets sold and a

record ten C6sars (Best Film, Best Direcror, Best Scenario, Best Actor/

Gdrard Depardieu, Best Actress/Catherine Deneuve, Best Photography,

Best Montage, Best Set, Best Music, and Best Sound), Tbe I'att Metvo

proved a triumph for its director. Truffaut overcame a difficult chal-

Ienge, namely, to associate the work of two artistically diverse actors,

FREN'H CINEMA
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the most popular female actress from rhe r96os with the biggest male
actor from rhe r97os. The shooting began January 28, r98o, and the
film opened in Paris on September r7 , r98o. Tbe Las Metro, like most
of Truffaur's films, was a subtle picture in the way its intrigue explored
the characters, dexrerously revealing individual layers of rheir psyche.
The director's devorion to lilm, combined with his personal inrerest in
male-female relationships, is omnipresent in the many elemenrs of the
plot. The film was a signifrcant illustration of Truffaut's modus oner-
andi: communicaLion jepends p.i..lfJlf 

"" 
r;grr, 

""a 
r*", i" 

"iJ.tfor the cinematography to creare a faultless environment. This faulrless
mise-en-scbne was actually re-cr€ated by srage decorator Jean-Pierre
Kohut-Svelko and chief lighting operator Nestor Almendros through
an unusual series of almost monochromatic colors, eventually rendering
the mood of the Occupation more realistic for the everyday reality of
artists during this time and rediously atilicial ro accompany the the-
atrical representation.

Truffaut's next lilm, Tbe Waman Next Doar (La fetame td cdt6,
r98r)," was a "frightening" Iove story where passion surpassed com-
mon neutosis. On a cinematographic level, the narative of fatal anrac-
tion could be viewed as a psychoanalysis of contrasting implications
behind the form of long takes, numerous crcss-curring, and fluid-
camera movemenrs. From starr to linish, the intrigue reveals the phys-

G€rard Depardieu (Bernard) ald Catherine Deneuve (Marion) in Frangois Truffauc s
Tbe Lut Metro (Iz clanier mdtro, r98<)), (Conrtesy of BIFI/O Jean-Pierre Fizet).
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ical hindrances between the couple. A sense of isolation and abandon
grows stronger until the linal explosion of energy recaptures what had
been lost. Bernard (G6rard Depardieu) and Arlette Coudray (MichEle

Baumgartner), a young couple, live a peaceful life outside Grenoble
with rheir young son. One day, a new couple, Philippe (Henri Garcin)
and Mathilde Bauchard (Fanny Ardant), move in next door. After a

seven-year separation, dest.iny brings Bernard and Mathilde back to-
gether. At first reluctant even ro behave like friends, the couple
inevitably has an affair. Bernard and Mathilde begin their secret ren-
dezvous in town as their passion gror.s mercilessly. One day, Bernard

cannot control himself any longer. Life must go on as each couple
pretends to live with the indiscretion and forgive the past. Meanwhile,
however, Nlathilde is hospitalized suffering from depression. Philippe
and Mathilde move out of town, but one night Mathilde returns to
visit rheir deserted house. Bernard overhears the noise and reencountefs
her one last time. As passion again becomes all-consuming, Mathilde
shoots Bernard before killing herself.

IWtth The Vlrudn Next Daor, as he did with The llan Vlho Lrned

Vomen and The Snry of Adele F1., Truffaut acquainted his public with

another saga of passionare love, this time with rhe looming sensation
evolving in an apparently convivial-bourgeois environment, chronicled
by the peaceful village outside the innumerable disturbances of city
life. Interestingly, many of Truffaut's lilms used a narrative frame

under a voice-over, like rhe puzzling prologue of Madame Jouve,
(V6ronique Silver) during the opening shot, who instructs the sPectator
that the fearured story not only is authentic but also a reminder that
everybody's life is at some point unstable. Once more with Truffaut'
who was still dealing with the emorional aftermath of The Green Roont,
the idea of death was equally present as the symbol of love in the final
adage of the narrarive: reminiscing temptation can eventually lead
human beings to a fatal finale.

On August r, 1984, Franqois Truffaur had a cerebral stroke from a

brain tumor and died a month later at the age of frfty-two at the
American Hospital in Neuilly. Exactly thirty years eadier, Truffaut
had entered the arena as a turbulent critic for ler tabiers du cinttna and
as a fierce opponent of the tradition de qaality'.'( He ruthlessly foughr
cinematographic academicism and its overpowering literary adapta-
tions, as well as its anti-intellectual character. For Truffaut and the
young critics-turned-directors of the nouuelle rdgae, the aspiration to

lilm corresponded to a poeticized but still realisric rePresentation of
contemporary France, and was a cinematographic revolution in all its

artistic and production aspects. According to film critic David rValsh,

Truffaut's cinema with its "self-consciously Bressonian austeriry, still
retains its essential eloouence.' '" Heir to the humanistic cinematrc
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tradition of Jean Renoir, Truffaut is remembered by both popular

audiences and film historians as a unique lilmmaker known for his

contagious, exuberant celebration of filmmaking. Ahvays involved

with the production of his 6lms as well as the well-being of his

orofession. Truffaut was also active as a film critic and commentatof
until the very end.'" Two of his most noteworthy manuscripts include
a long interview with Alfred Hitchcock" and a collection of critical

essays, Ler f.lxu de ma tie (Tbe Films ix My Life, 1975). Physically

hampered during the last months of his life, Truffaut had already

planned numerous projects, including an adaptation of Paul Ldautaud's

Peti atni aad Le Cante de Monte Crtll for American relevision. In

addirion, he had completed the screenplay for La petite '-ale re, whrch

Claude Miller directed in r988.
Following in Truffaut's foorsteps, director Bertrand Tavernier, al-

though active in filmmaking since the early r97os, quickly appeared

as an experienced lilmmaker in the following decade. The success of

Cledn Slate (Coup de torchon. r98t), followed by his immaculare im-
pressionistic composition A Sunday in tbe Coaxtty (LIn diraancbe ) /a

campagne, r984), conlirmed Tavernier's position as an artisr of consid-

erable influence. Adapted from a short novel by Pierre Bost, entitled

Monsieur Ladniral ud biertit uourir, A Suxdal, in tlse Coantrl narrares a

bittersweet ponrait of a man's life as he relives personal triumphs,
family comedies and tragedies, the volatile politics ofa war-torn wodd,

and, most importantly, the Feople and passions that changed his life.

During the last peaceful years before \World War I, Monsieur Lad-

miral (louis Ducreux), a retired painter, lives at his country home with

the memory of his late spouse. On a beautiful Sunday, he receives a

visit from his son, Gonzague (Michel Aumont), with his wile and three
children, Emile, Lucien, and N{ireil le. Realizing that his son has

slipped into a conformist bourgeois existence despite himself, Mon-
sieur ladmiral is disappointed with Gonzague's lack of ambition and

adventute. But rhe peaceful family also receives a surprise visit that

day from Monsieur Ladmiral's daughter IrEne (Sabine Az6ma), a thor-

oughly modern and independent young Parisian woman. Irdne's con-

tagious stamina and energy begin to spread to the whole family.

Unfortunately, she must rush back to Paris after a phone call from her

lover, who waits for her. Following his children's visit, Monsieur
Ladmiral then returns to his studio ro examine a painring that he has

been working on for years, and reminisces on the Passions and risks of

Iife never taken.
Continuing the theme of A Veek's Vacation (Une sextaine de uacatces,

r98o), Tavernier concentrated his interest on the rapport among the

three generations within a family, much like Ettore Scola had done tn
The Family (La famiglia, r987). In addition to the poetic evocation of



3 1 6  F R E N C H  C I N E M A

paternal love, A Sunday )n the C0 atry is an insightful analysis of a
family's interior dynamics and a moving account of an aging artist's
consciousness that his "masterpiece" may not survive rhe passage of
time. Here Tavernier's visual narfarive cenrers on the nresentation of
individuals' basic situations (which belc.rng ro daily lilet. It presents
individual human beings' intuition of their daily situations as they
experience them. Tavernier's protagonists are isolared, static, and mo-
tionless, and thus express themselves especially from the inside; they
are recognized through a picrure of rhe wodd rhar rhe filmmaker
designed for the spectaror. The whole peacefii chanpttre. or pseudo-
pastoral universe, is a symbol of the mental world of the characte$
who are organic pams of it. The reality of the situations in which the
characters appear is a psychological reality expressed in images that are
the outward projection of Monsieur Ladmiral's state of mind. Often
described as a filmmaker of the past, traditionallv exrolling cinemat-
ographic academicism in all its forms, Tavernier provided a rare rm-
pressionistic taste for atmosphere in rhis rransgenerational portrait of
a common family. He displayed an obvious mastery of stage direction.
With numerous shots focused on one figure before slowly tracking to
another angle, the cinematography was able to reveal in each take a
different aspect that placed a new spin on rhe set and directly en-
hanced a mood of hidden undercurrents. At the 1984 Cannes Film
Festival, ,4 Suxday ix tbe Country won Best Direcor (Prix de la mise
en scEne). It also won C6sars in t985 for Best Actress (Sabine Az6ma),
Best Adapted Screenplay (Bertrand Tavernier), and Best Photography
(Bruno de Keyser).

After the success of ,4 Sundal it tbe Countty, Tavernier developed a
parallel inrerest injazz. Following conracts with American filmmakers
Martin Scorsese and Irwin \7inkler, the idea of a feature {ilm narraring
the tribularions of American jazzrnen it France came rc light, 'Round

Midnigbt (Aatour dt ntinuit, ry86) and its international success demon-
strated thar a well-organized cinematography (assisted by Alexandre
Trauner for the set) coordinated with a judicious pace and a strorg
musical score (Herbie Hancock earned an Oscar for Best Score)'" could
do well at rhe box office, in particular among general audiences not
necessarily keen on or even knowledgeable about jazz. The lilm rs a
virtual homage to the jazz world: the music and rhe musicians who
lived and played in France. Dexter Gordon (who was nominated for an
Oscar) plays a disheartened tenor saxophone player living in self-exile
in 1959 Paris. A young amareur, Francis Paudras (Frangois Cluzet),
who first sureptitiously listens to rhe musician in the rain (since he
cannot afford to pay admission to rhe Blue Note CIub), is disappoinred
ar the way this jazz great is treated and decides to help his idol. The
story is a compelling reflecrion on the phenomenon of appreciarion
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toward aftists and their subsequent interaction with fans. The title,

taken from a Thelonious Monk piece, conveys the genuine armosphere

more than a literal narrative scheme.
Author of numerous afticles, Taverniet also wrote, with Jean-Pierre

Coursodon, a historical overview of American cinema ftom the post-

war era, entitled 50 Lnr de cindna amiricain tn t995." Today, Taver-

nier remains one of the most important and Popular French

filmmakers. His other signiflcant contributions ate Deatbuatch (Ld

woft en di,"ect, r98o) and Life and Nothing Bat (La de et rien d aatre'

rg89), a pacilist film statring Philippe Noiret as a lforld \Var I

major obsessed with making amends for the wartime carnage in

which he took part. It is a persuasive investigation of the absurdity of

war, Tavernier's cateer awards include the Prix louis Delluc in 1974

for L'horloger de Saint-Paul and two C6sars for Best Director in 1976

for Let Joy Reign Supreme (Que k fAte camttence) and h l'997 fot Captan

Coxan and Best Original Screenplay for The Jadge ard the Arasin (Le

juge et l'iaauin) in ry77.

Compared to filmmakers such as Tavernier, FranEois Truffaut, or even

Jean-Luc Godard, Bertrand Blier can be considered, in his own style, a

very conscientious observer of psychological conflicts. Like the others,
Blier concentrated his work on a great deal of stage direction rather

than subjective expression. In comparison to the film directors of the

eady r96os, who found inspiration and artistic encouragement mostly

within their inner selves or favqrite literature, Blier goes as far as to

capture inspiration from around him (e.g., Going Placu a d Cet Oat

Your Handkerchiels). Wtth' Beau-ptre (Beau-Pire, r98r), selected for the

r98r Cannes Film Festival, the continuity in his endeavor to direcc

confronrational films is still noticeabl€. Often viewed as a nonconform-
ist, whose vulgarity and provocation go beyond understanding, Blier
is either rejected by the French public and critics or adored. Blier's
infuriaring scripts were obviously written to astound spectators as early
as the 6rst scene, when unexpected situations diffused a recurrent-
corrosive humor. Built on paradoxical situations, the plots were then
pushed to the limits of cinematographic frenzy, according to a logic of
absurdity that could be best described as a blend of Surrealist fantasy

and Existentialist uneasiness. Blier's characters usually evolve in dra-

maric situations, sometimes in despair and sometimes in absolute
derision. In Bertu-fire, love and sex, breaking the bourgeois rules by

rheir unbalanced and extreme nature, begin to take the form of a

comedy of despair. For film historian Ren6 Pr6dal, Blier's concept in

filmrnaking, and storytelling in particular, is the antirhesis of artistic
malleability since "Blier's cinema is incongtuous as it tracks down
emotions with a bulldozer and incise pain with a needle."" Despire
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the depth of the implied sexuality, Beau-pire mixes a signilicant dimen-
s ion  o f  humor  w i rh  a  r rag ic  s to ry .

The plot centers on R€mi (Patrick Dewaere), an almost-thirty-year-
old composer and a philosophically disposed nightclub pianist who
yearns to embrace a successful life before his next birthday. Discour-
aged by the melancholy of his professional career, R6mi limits himself
to playing at night in fancy restauranrs in order to survive linancially.
His longtime companion, Martine (Nicole Garcia), dies in a car acci-
dent, leaving her fourreen-year-old daughter, Marion (Ariel Besse),
without a parent. Charly (Maurice Ronet), the child's biological father,
wants ro take her back home. Although extremely attached to her,
R6mi takes Marion back ro her father. After several weeks
Marion, who has missed her "stepdad," suddenly stops by
apartment with her belongings. A romance begins to blossom imme-
diarely in the young teenager's imagination, bur R6mi refuses to cede
to temptation. He soon realizes that she in fact offers him emotional
support. Meanwhile, Marion, desperate by his denial, loses her appetire
for life and begins a slow slide into depression. She kisses R€mi one
day, however, as he is taking her on rhe train for a ski rrip. The
romance takes a new turn, as both protagonists cannor live without
each other, until R6mi meers Chadotte, a single woman his age.
Marion linally understands that her future will be separate from R6mi's
and reluctantly goes back to her father.

Ofren banal and even somewhat mediocre in nature. Blier's charac-
ters are meticulous studies in psychology, much as Franqois Truffaut
or Bertrand Tavernier do with their own protagonists: they all possess
and communicate the flavor and pathos of life. Despite his congenial
front, his humanist heart illustrated in its broad vision and bold
courage, Rdmi is actually a disturbed man. His fascination wirh Mar-
ion increasingly betrays his fragile self. Tender and violent, Blier goes
beyond the tolerable limit on every occasioo, and his visual insolence
places his protagonist in impossible siruations. For many French crir-
ics, Blier has always been an astonishing and influential director due
in part ro his representation of siruarions inspired by the theater of rhe
absurd and outrag€ous dialogues rich in new colloquial expressions.
The film does not lack the scope of many of his previous films, and the
dose of hypnotism may be even more. pef,suasive than Get azt Yoar
Hanherchief:.

Five years later, Blier achieved a determinant picture with his very
controversial Mdxage (Texue dc :oirie, ..9l)6), for which he wrote the
script and assigned the music score to trendy musician and songwrirer
Serge Gainsbourg. Overpowering in its unlimited audaciry, Xl[nage rs
the most drasric and unprecedented depicrion of the love triangle tn
motion-picture history. This time, it is the man who is conquered

away,
R6mi's
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rvhen a stranger comes to insert himself in the privacy of a couple.
Antoine (Michel Blanc) and Monique (Miou-Miou), a young, strug-
gling couple, often argue about their poverty. Between fights and
tenderness, they exist without any direction. One night, however, their
lives change drasticaLly when they meet Bob (G€rard Depardieu) in an
outdoor baf. I7hat Monique stives for is simply a life of leisure and
luxury. Bob impresses Monique and persuades Antoine to befriend
him, After initiating the young couple to his lifestyle (of professional
burglary), Bob, who lirst gave the impression that he was atttacted to
Monique, slowly makes his move on Antoine, who ultimately will
become no less than his sexual-domesric slave. Bob is not so much
concerned with sexuality as he is in manipr. ating the pair, in order to
have rhem go along wirh his disturbing plans. Far from being jealous,
Monique is complacent as long as her new glamorous lifestyle conrin-
ues. As the m€nage i trois progresses, Monique's plight becomes more
and more difficult as she becomes unwanted by the trvo men. She
eventually leaves for another man. Within a matter of da1's, Monique
and Antoine have been removed from their dull middle-class universe
and parachuted into a gloomy sexual and criminal predicament. Now
liberated from rhe feminine presence, the male couple spend their days
in a Paris suburban home until one night, when Bob meets a yountsr
man in a disco. The end of the film enters the domain of frenzy as
Monique, who by then, having gotten rid of her man (rvho was no
more than a pimp), meets up r.ith Bob and Antoine again. By now,
Antoine's submission to Bob's desire is so strong rhat he freely dresses
in drag. Thirteen years after the controversy of Gabtg Places, Blier's,,Vy'-
nage ttrggeted considerable controversy once again, The manner in
which Antoine and Bob appear in their startling 6nal exposure rnakes
the characters of La crzge aax folles look like neophytes. The role ofAn-
toine, no longer possible for Patrick Dewaere, who died in 1982, was
offered to Bernard Giraudeau, who declined due to the sardonic tone of
the film, and linally rvent to Michel Blanc, who not only accepted the
role bur also earned the award for Best Actor (along with Bob Hoskins
for Neil Jordan's Mana Lisa) at the 1986 Cannes Film Festival.

The key to understanding Blier's films is to be found in his rreat-
ment of the absurd. In what circumstances, then, does absurdity appear
in Blier's scenarios? If spectators accept the possibility of common
sense, and convenient logic may be absent, the dialogues consequently
become enrirely irrational and even absurd. The conflict between the
world and human beings, who begin to be disillusioned with it, arises
here. Can a simple fictional story, Blier suggests, be written about a
topic that delies ridicule and rhe absurd? What Blier tried to capture
in Mdnage, however, was the feeling of absurdiry inherent in the human
condition as such, independent of personal motives. Blier's sense of the
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absurd emerges from daily life as an anecdote that relates to Every-
man's seemingly, banal existence.

Despite an element of rbe uncanny that is always pan of the in-
trigue, we never leave rhe domain of realism. Often labeled a misogy-
nist artist, especially by American film critics, Blier, whose
protagonists often display unconventional attitudes toward women,
does not promote an uninhibited worldview of erotic chauvinism or
anarchy. The principal idea is to be found in social experimenratron,
as ficrion usually allows viewers to do so. Strong with solid elements
of social insurrection and provocation, Blier's visual paradigm centers
on the love rriangle to understand irs sexual options, from heterosexu-
ality to homosexuality. For Blier, comic tales, expressed on the screen,
are the result of these options and discrepancies. Rather small and
balding, with a discontented gaze, Antoine is the Iess plausible lover,
just as the crude and conceited Bob is the less plausible of kindhearted
lovers. Therefore, Iife is not absurd in itself, it only appears so. The
nature of tbis discrepancy has ro be carefully understood as Antorne
progressively uncovers the ''feminine condition.'' On the threshold of
Blier's universe lies the promise of grasping a knowledge far beyond
the regions of frustrated feelings; this new awateness neither contra-
dicts nor offsets the absurd but balances it, following the author's
intuit ion.

\7hat can be seen as Blier's gteatest quality as a storyteller is his
relentless ability to put his own beliefs at risk. This acrive humility
disarms his detractors and their label of "macho" or misogynist cinema.
Visually speaking, the trademark of Blier's style is best described as a
cinema of constanr provocative close-ups blended with unbelievable
pieces of reality and prosaic trurhs. Blier's next 6lm, Too Beartiful far
You (Trop helle pour tai, r989), conquered the forty-second Cannes Film
Festival in r99o with the Special Jury Prize (shared with Giuseppe
Tornatore's Cinmta Paradiso). In France, Too Beatttiful for Yoa received
a series of awards, including C6sars for Best Film, Best Director, Best
Acrress (Carole Bouquet), Best Scenario (Bertrand Blier), and Best
Editing (Claudine Merlin).

The story narrates the extraordinary relationship that has suddenly
been brought to passion between ordinary-looking interim secretary
Colette Chevassu (Josiane Balasko) and automobile dealership manager
Bernard Barth6l6my (G€rard Depardieu). After fourteen years of mar-
riage, Bernard seems to have it all: a beautiful wife, Florence (Carole
Bouquet), two lovely children, and a very prosperous livelihood. How-
ever, he is immediately caught up in an intense love-at-first-sight
situation. Through the glass walls of his office, Bernard's eyes meet
Colette's, and th€ passionate couple begin to meet secretly in motel
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rooms. All of his friends afe astonished, since Bernard's wife, Floreree,
is beautiful. She is not disposed to let go of Bernard and battles back
with a vehement arrogance. Although challenged in person by Ber-
nard's wife, Colette, still ''quivering" 

with bliss, manages to ask the
unthinkable in an arypical wife-mistress altercation: "Vous pouvez pas
me le pr€ter encore un tout petit peu? Il est bien avec moi, il est
calme, il se repose. Quand je vais vous le rendre, il sera tout neuf; vous
repartirez comme au premier jour." (Can you lend him to me a bit
longeri,He likes it with rne; he's calm, he rests- I ' l l  return him to you
like new. You can start all over again.)

Introducing a hyper reality composed of phantasmagoric images ancl
phorographed with great passion by Philippe Rousselot Qean-Jacques
Berrreix's Dita, Stephen Frears's Dangerous Liainns), the narrative flash-
backs and llash-forwards take the viewer from Bernard's wedding to
Florence after he begins the relationship rvith his new mistress. Blier
has converged many of his film subjects representing male sexuality
somerimes to the detrimenr of women, as most American crirics Iike
to remind-but rhis time he shows signs of moving more roward a
compassionate and balanced psychoanalysis. The lilm is a disquieting
tale, unsemling for the conservative minded, mixing burlesque comedy
with drama, phantasms with the absurd. Once more, as in Mdnage, the
element of absurdity does not reflect on yesterday or tomorrow. Ber-
nard is also a typically absurd hero, personifying rhe real qualiry of an
absurd life. He is absurd through his passion for Colerte, his suffering
through his eternal fate, and his timeless quest for an idyllic love that
can never be grasped. Although he is offered furtive momenrs with
Coleme, as an absurd character, Bernard misses any hopes, plans, and
troubles about his future: so argues Bertrand Blier. One can see the
great effon in him, recuring as he tries to move rhe expectarion and
push it up to the very last day. The lilm is Iaced with liberal amounts
of offbeat humor and follows an unusual reverse order of melodramaric
inrrigue, since it begins within the domain of comedy, only to end as
a more setious tepresentation of the human condition. The two rhe-
matic threads are interwoven with grear artistic gusto, and are finally
emotionally fused in a climactic sequence that links the comedy to rhe
drama. G6rard Depardieu, who plays the character of an ordinary man
in a midlife crisis, communicates credibility in one of the mosr difliculr
roles in cinema. Depardieu makes his love obsession convincing be-
cause he never overacts ir. and because the movie communicates it
generally through the point of view of rhe actresses, Bouquet and
Balasko. Blier's Ttn Beautiful for You was the third time Gdrard Depar-
dieu and Carole Bouquet performed together aftet Cold Cutt and Pht-
lippe Labro's Riue droie, riue gaucbe (.1984).
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A fourth director of the posr-'68 era who was still a force in the
r98os is Maurice Pialat. Pialat unpredictably spun his conremporary
films in a style borrowed from classic films and cin€ma v6rit6. He

deconstructed, systemized, and reinvented Processes by breaking rhe

rules of aesthetics with minimum lighting and austere realism. The
spectator had the impression that the director invited audiences to
share his fascination with melodrama bur at the same time provided
him with the necessary conditions to remain in full control. Often
considered a chronicler more than a creator, Pialat's strength resided
in the sincerity of the script as he alternared extremely diverse sequen-
tial shots: strong moments captured with a mobile hand camera-to
best grapple rvith the behavior and the language of the characters-
interspersed with rather banal excerpts of everyday life. Pialat was also
known for his demanding treatment of actors and his memorable
bursts of wrath, which explains why, in the director's universe, the
individual always l ived wirhin close ties with society-

One of the most socially and politically charged of all French pro-

ductions of rhe early parr of the decade was undeniably Pra.lat's Lculat
(Loulaa. r98o). This 6lm was all the more paradoxical for a filmmaker
who always refused the title ofpolitical cineast. Although a love story
in theory, PiaIat's Lo aa took advantage of each scene to remind
viewers of the prominence of class awareness in modern French society.
Nelly (Isabelle Huppert) is a middle-class rvoman matried to a rvell-

off publicist named Andr6 (Guy Marchand). Together, they live in a

comfbrrable and spacious Parisian apartmenr. One night at a ball,
Nelly meets Loulou (G6rard Depardieu), a tongh laubard (thug), and
immediately falls in love with him. Because Loulou seems so lar away
from reality, she is irresistibly attracted to this hoodlum and eventually
leaves Andr6 for Loulou, sacrificing her curtent lifestyle to pursue her
inner clesire. While Loulou tives off Nelly's money in exchange for
sexual and emotional fulfillment, she becomes pregnant. Nelly's
brother attemprs to assist the young couple by suggesting employmeor
possibil i t ies for Loulou, but much to his dismay, the future father is
in no hurry to begin a full-time job. Often described as an ''erotic

revolution" in the American press, Pialat's love story is far from rep-
resenting a radical change from r97os sexuality. Trapped between two
decades, the film actually serves a rather smooth transition between
the sexual freedom of the post-'68 era and the return to storytelling of
rhe r 98os.

However, the true innovation of Pialat at the dawn of the r98os
was the value he gave to the still often-underestimated importance of
sex in social interactions and human patterns. Interestingly enough,
Laulou addrcsses the notion of social abuse and the ambiguous affnity
of a couple whose bond corresponds to the dialectical behavior of
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reciprocal exploitation. The thin line that separares the exploiter and
the exploited reminds the spectator that social barriers, although tem-
porarilv put aside, may uhimately haunt any couple in the end. Far
from a purely political or socially rhetorical approach, the plot indulges
in a witness of two individuals in love and their dorvnfall in a hostile
wodd, eventually leading to violence, boredom, deception, alcohoLsm,
and, finally, love. Arlette langmann's scenario, offering the two differ-
ent languages, gave a vital force to the film. Pialat's work may be
considered a slice of life, without a real beginning or a real ending;
but it certainly is a compelling tesrimony of rhe "conflictual" predrca-
ment of class struggle in the r98os. Included in the French Official
selection at Cannes in r98o, rhe 6lm gained international fame, al-
though it was excluded from rhe flnal award list (wirh a similar fate ar
the C6sar Awards ceremony, as a result of the phenomenal success of
Truffaur's The Lax Aletra).

After the success of Pialat's next fikn, A xot arnoars (:1983), Ftench
critics were eager to see if Pialat could continue and confirm his earlier
successful accomplishments. Under tbe Sun of Satan (,Sous le nleil rLe
Satar. 1987) divided critics while reassuring fans with the rriumph of
the precious Palme d'or at the fortieth Cannes Film Festival in r987.
Endowed rvith a self-consciously Bressonian ausrerity, Pialat's cinema-
tography retained its essential eloquence, despite an excessir,r exposi-
liqn-1hs evident vicissitudes of the dispirited priest who fails to save
souls, including his own. For the first time in nine films, Pialat
confronted a lirerary adaptation, with Georges Bernanos s lirst novel.
To this date, no French film had received the presrigious Palme d'or
since Claude lelouch's A Man and a \Vouan (.Ux bnmme et ane fetnne.
t966). \(ith a continuous use of narrative ellipses, Pialat's script
examines the fall of a young count(y priest in rhe north of France who
falls prey to doubts of his own spiritual vocation.

In a small Artois village, Germaine Malorrhy, an adolescent also
called Mouchette (Sandrine Bonnaire), is rhe mistress of the marquis
de Cadignan. One nighr, she reveals her pregnancy ro her lover, and
following his indifferent reaction, she kills him with his hunring gurr.
The police conclude it is an act of suicide. Meanwhile, Donissan
(G6rard Depardieu), an unpretentious and frail priesr, is struggJing
with his ecclesiastical assignment. In many instances, he confesses to
his father superior, the abbot Menou-Segrais (Maurice Pialat), a request
ro abandon his faith and his methodical recourse ro self-llagellation.
One night, as he walks along a counrry road, he is confronted by Satan,
who appears in front of him as a peasant. Once freed from his psycho-
logical onslaughts, Donissan conrinues his journey ro the village. There
he meets Mouchette, who confesses to him her abortion. Donissan,
touched by the depth of the tragedy that unfolds before him, tries to
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help her, but ro no avail. One day later, she is found dead, her throat

slit. Back at home, Donissan is sent to a new parish in Lumbres, where
he suddenly dies inside a confessional booth, on his way to sanctity.

The film generated a great deal of controversy, and at the 1987
Cannes Film Festival, Pialat received the Palme d'or under the insults
and contemptuous growls of the crowd at the awards ceremony. FIe
responded immediately by raising his 6st in the air and saying: "Sl
x)0/A ne n'ainez pa[, k peux tous dire que je rc ttaus aitne pas non plus!"

under rhe compassionate, yet discomforted, smile of Yves Montand,
president of the jury- For many of his opponents, Pialat's cinema
proved to be too academic as he all too willingly injected his own
interpretation of the novel, resulting in a movie far removed from
filmed prose. \7hat all Robert Bresson admirers expeced to see (like

Pialat, Bresson adapted a novel from Bernanos in the r95os; see chap-
rer 4) was perhaps a coherent narrative plot, which through its com-
plexity and depth would have exposed a certain visual eloquence with
sincere subjectivity. Fot many critics, Pialat's stoic portrait is an em-
blem of Bernanos's spiritual investigation, the exhausting obstacles a
born outsider encounteff in communicaring his faith to and for others.
For them, it is simply a betrayal of Bernanos's legacy or a pale imita-
tiofl of Bresson's cinema.

Uncompromisingly rigorous and harsh, Pialat's high-powered adap-
tation of Bernanos's novel is undoubtedly a dark 6lm, both literally
and figuratively. It follows the chilling but compassionate atmosphere
and rhe light of mystical anguish against evil forces much like Rob-
err Bresson's r95r Diary af a Country Priest, Moachexe (Mouchette, 1967)
or even Philippe Agostini and Raymond-L6opold Btuckberger's 1-e
dia/ogue d.et carmy'lites (196o1 mixed with the omnipresence of the
French countryside, under ominous gray skies that serve to accentuate
the twin sentimenrs of isolation and a hostile environment.

THE SUPER PRODUCTIONS: CLAUDE BERRI AND
JEAN-JACQUES ANNAUD

Although often commonly regarded from an Ametican point of view
as grear contr.ibutions to cinematography, French critics usually like
to remind moviegoers that big-budget productions mosrly concentrate
on less serious narratives, complex slage Froductions, and highly struc-
rured camera mevements to the exclusion of heavy conrent. Although
sporadic when compared to American cinema, French big-budget 6lms
did well at the box office during the r98os. One of the major figures
of the moment was producer-director Claude Berri. Born in Paris in
1934, Berrl entered the industry in small parts such as Chabrol's ZEe
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Girls (Lu bannes femwes, r95o) and Clouzot'sThe Trath (I-a vbit{, ry6o).
By ry61, he had signilicantly advanced his career as he directed TDs
Tuo of Ut (Le deil bantne et I'enfaltt), his first feature. Producing the
majority of his 6lms, Claude Berri also began to coproduce other
directors' 6lms, such as Jacques Rivette's Celine and Julie Go Baatixg
(C//ine et Julie unt er bateaa, r97 4) and Claude Zrdi's ln:pector La Batu.rc
(L'irspectear Ia bature, r98o). His most significant productions as a
6lmmaker were I* naitre d dcole (.r98r), Tcbaa Pantin.t (1983), Jean de
Flaretn (t986), Manon af the Sp ng (Manu? du tourcet, 1986), Uranr:
(Uraxus, t99o), Guwinal (t991, and Lacie Aubrac (t997).

The case of Tchaa Pantin! demonstrates that any cinematic entefprise
implies aesthetic choices- Berri, like many other artists of his tirne,
imposed an aurhentically personal universe and a private vision of
French society in a close observation of human tragedy. Adapted from
a novel by Alain Page (his first literary adaptation in ten flms, srnce
Berri usually brought his own script ro th€ screen), the movie won live
C6sars in 1984: Best Actor (Coluche), Best Supporting Actor and Best
Newcomer (Richard Anconina), Best Photography (Bruno Nuytten),
and Best Sound (Jean LabussiEre and Gdrard Lamps).'l

Lambert (Coluche) works the night shift at a suburban gas station.
He tries ro forget the dullness of his existence by drinking. Resigned
to an existence of alcohol and attentitme, he does not expect much from
life until he meers Bensoussan (Richard Anconina), a young man who
one nighr stops to refill his moped. The friendship develops as both
men realize that their solitude in life is not unique. Half Jewish and
half Arab, Bensoussan lives off drug dealing. Although disappointed
in Bensoussan (his own son died of a drug overdose), lambert still
maintains an unyielding friendship. One nighr, the young man is
killed by rival drug dealers in front of Lamberr, who swears to avenge
his friend. Vith Bensoussan's death, the dreadful past suddenly re-
emerges in Lambert's mind. Emotionally desttoyed, Lambem, also a
former cop, conducts his own investigation. He meets Lola (Agnis
Soral), an acquaintance of Bensoussan, who will eventually lead him to
Rachid (Mahmoud Zemmouri), a bar dwner also heavily implicated in
Parisian drug-traffic circles. Finally, Lambert kills Rachid to avenge
his young friend and indirectly the memory of his son.

Chief operator (photography) Bruno Nuytten gave the movie a
dreamlike quality, a kind of dark sensuality that permeated every
frame. There was depth in the images as well as a kind of mystical
sense that made rhe suburban Parisian underworld and the individuals
who lived within ir as importanr ro the story as rhe actors. The urban
stylizarion and blue back lighting combined to retain a uniquely
Parisian feel. With sets by Alexandre Trauner,'{ representing the fa-
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miliar mood of Belleville, the film was able to re-create, on irs own
terms and atmosphere, a piece of the rglos poetic realism associated
wirh rhe dramatic tension of f i lm noir.

Although Berri had no guarantee for the success of the film, he
heavily emphasized the importance and visibility of the cenrral player,
Coluche. Known as rhe most popular stand-up comedian in France,
Coluche had never had the opportunity to fully reveal his acting talent
in the field of pure drama. Berri's fascination with acrors and real
acting allowed Coluche, who was struggling with drugs in real life, to
endow the entire film with a special resonance. In a style reminiscent
ofJean Gabin in the prewar era (e.g., Daybreah. Port of Sha&ws, Louer
Boy, Thel rX/ere Fiue), the character of Lambert bewilders and at the
same time seduces viewers with his immobile gaze while indirectly
exuding from within an aptilude for his character's communicability.
Humanitarian craftsmanship, visual perspicacity, and refined sentiment
are the hallmarks of Claude Berri's visual cinema. Even perfect acting,
Berri acknowledged, can be covered with the smallest movements:

I wanted Coluche's face to radiate.with more and more lisht and bc
more and more handsome. I asked Bruno Nuytten, my cametaman, to
light him and choose angles to favor this metamorphosis. For Coluche,
the relief in having almost linished the 61m and knorving he was at the
eod of his work combined with che relief of Lamberr who finishes rvith
revenge, rn rhe depths of which the hope of love is reborn. \What I'm
talking about is not directing an actor but a more intimate relationship
between an actor aod a director."

The end result of the film corresponds to an epic variation on Berri's
continual evocation that love can be indispensable, desirable, punish-
ing, and desrructive all at the same time. Tcbao Pantin! was a decep-
tively composed film with an inherent connotation of modern-times
poetic realism that eventually materialized through its visual surface,
efupting in the emotional violence of thwarted and misdirected love.
The C6sar for Best Actor awarded to lead actor Coluche was the
crowning touch for the comedian. Born Michel Colucci in Paris, Col-
uche (r948-86) thanks to the supporr of actor Romain Bouteille-
pafticipared in the famous Cafi de la Gare (a renowned, cabaret for
stand-up comedians) with future celebrities such as Miou-Miou and
Patrick Dewaete. Coluche began as a seasoned nightclub petformer,
and used the one-hour format to reveal more of himself as he often
addressed the problems rhat the show endured in his audacious mono-
logues (audacious for some, outfageous for others). In 1974, his solo
career took off. Coluche often took questions from the audience, which
frequently led to some uproarious exchanges and gave him a chance to
exhibit his sharp wit. The sketches were better than the usual-\'ariety



Coluche (lamben) and Richard Anconina (Bensoussan) in Claude Berrt s Trhao

Pdntin! (r98r, (Corrtesy of BIFI/O Renn Productions).

Gdrard Depardieu Qean de Florette) in Clatde Bertl'sJean de Florelte Uean .le FImette,

r986), (Courtesy of BIFI/O Renn Productions).
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fare, with Coluche walking off the set in the middle of routines over
differences with the producers, and generally acting rhe peruranr,
spoiled superstar role. His tell-it-like-it-is humor influenced French
comics of his own generarion, as well as those who came later (Les
Inconnus, Muriel Robin, Smaih, etc.). Anticipating the liberalizatron
ofrhe r98os, Coluche believed humor was to some exrenr the key ro
curing the prejudices of society. Coluche immediately captured the
hearts of television viewers in the most advenrurous radio and TV
shows of the r97os and eady r98os. Ir was his starring performance
in one of the grear music halls that made Coluche a household name
in French cinema. In r98o, Coluche truly made national headlines.
After announcing his candidacy for the presidential elections, he was
credited with between ro and 16 percenr of the votes in the polls

Meanwhile, despite purting on hold his comedic vocarion, Coluche
forged a successful acting career with commercial lilms such as Claude
Zidi's The lYing ar tbe Tbigh (L'aile oi la cuiue, r9j6), Ittspectlr La
Barure, Le maitre tl y'tole (198t), and Banzai (r983); Jean Yanne's Quar-
tu to 'fu'a before Juu: Chritt (Deux beares tuoin: Ie q&afi arant Jdsus-Cbri:t,
r98z); Bertrand Blier's Ml, Bex Friend s Gil (La fernrne de mon pole,
r983); and especially Tcbao Pantin!

Taking everyone by surprise in the mid-r98os, the actor created an
unprecedented charitable initiative, which to this day remains one of
France's foremost humanitarian enterorises: the Resros du Coeur.'6 In
addition to his effons ro create a new 6scal larv rhar would ease taxes
on companies in exchange for donations to his association, Coluche
secretly offered r-5 million francs to I'Abb6 Pierre, one of France s
greatest advocates for the homeless.'7 But Coluche's career tragically
came to an end one afternoon in June 1986. In a mororbike accioenr,
he hit a truck on a road in southern France. At his funeral on June :4,
1986, at the famous PEre Lachaise cemetery, a myriad of 6lm actors
and directors (Yves Montand,'3 Roman Polanski, Miou-Miou, Michel
leeb, Richard Berry, Josiane Balasko, Richard Anconina, Thierry Le
Luron, I'Abb6 Pierre, Michel Blanc, Gdrard Jugnor, Dominique Lavan-
ant, Michel Boujenah, among others), as well as celebrities from all
political and artistic backgrounds, gathered to salute one of France's
most popular artistic figures. In rhe true tradition of the court jesrer,
Coluche de6ed religious and political institutions, racism, and political
correctoess in all their forms and opened the gates for an entire gener-
ation of new comedians. \With the psychology of a clown, he had the
ability to invert the rapport of confronrarion, of derision, and of ridi-
cule. Coluche was the hero of a whole generation, not only the post-
68's but also the entire yourh ofthe r98os.

Three years after the success of Tchao Paxtin!, Claude Berri em-
barked on another challenge: Marcel Pagnol's L'eau des collines. Based
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on a folk tale of his native Provence, Pagnol's novel directly inspired

Betri to remake what only Pagnol seemed to have been able to direct

flawlessly: Jean de F lorette and Manan des soatces. Thirty -five years eafi ier)

Pagnol had himself attempted to make a feature film out of llanan det

taurcet (rg1z), which included only the second part of the novel, and

whose main protagonist was his spouse, Jacqueline Pagnol It was with

her consent-mostly due to the anticipated presence of actor Yves

Montand-that Berri obtained permission to readapt the novel to the

screen- In the same way Pagnol did with his ProvenEal characters three

decades earlier, Claude Berri's efforts deliberately focused Particular
attention on his personages' disposition and language, partlv with the

assistance of the actors' southern accenas.
The fr,rst "act," Jean de Fluan. is set between the two world wars in

a small village in Provence called les Bastides, where Cdsar Soubeyran
(Yves Montand) is the last guardian of his family's herirage. Under

pressure to carry on the lineage through his simpleminded nephew,

Ugolin (Daniel Auteuil), he covets his neighbor's land for its natural-

flowing spring. The land belongs to Jean de Florette (G6rard Depar-

dieu). a hunchback tax collecror and newcomet from the city, who

settles in the country with his wife, Aim6e (Elisabeth Depardieu), and

daughter, Manon (Ernestine Mazurowna), to begin life afresh. He

decides to raise vegetables and rabbits on the property, which, accord-

ing to the map, contains the aforementioned freshwater source- The

Soubeyrans must acquire rhe laod at all costs and thus deYelop a

Machiavellian stratagem. Manipulated by his scheming uncle, Ugolin

secretly blocks the spring with concrete, covering its site and hoping

to ruin the value of the ProPerty, since the summer will bring little

rain. Meanwhile, they borh pretend to suPPort Jean's efforts. By forc-

ing him to get his water miles away, they hope to discourage him

from staying in this hostile nature and consequently resell his property

At the beginning, the frequenr rains favor the growth of the vegeta-

bles, and the rabbits multiply. Then comes the drought, and Jean ts

compelled to carry water from a neighboring well, using his own

strength, and consequently literally transforming himself into a beast

of burden. Cdsar sends Ugolin to befriend the optimistic Jean. Facing

the adversity of an extended drought, Jean is desperate to borrow a

mule ro help haul water from a nearby spring, but his efforts are to no

avail. All day long, the man transports water under the burning sun

of Provence. But Jean is much mote tenacious than both expected, as

he decides to intensify his work until the day when, exhausted by the

inhumane amount ofwork, Jean is killed by a charge of dynamite. His

death means victory for Ugolin and his uncle and the realization of

their carnation-Srowing project. As the widow and daughter are abour

to leave the house, Manon comes uPon the two men singing in victory
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rvhile unclogging the spring. Her whole life unfolds before her as she
instantly understands the devilish plot to which she and her family
have been victim,

The second "act," Maron of tbe Spring, unfolds the suspense with the
calculated pace of a Greek tragedy toward the inexorable resolution of
justice. The account rakes place a decade later when Manon (Emman-
uelle Biart), by now a beautiful young woman who lusrs for reverrge,
has returned to the hills of Provence ro shepherd goats on rhe moun-
tainside while living in poveny, rarher than staying with her mother
in Marseille. After the aging C6sar and Ugolin become owners of the
land, she reveals the long-silenced crime to the villagers. Ugolin, who
has noticed the beautiful shepherdess on the hills, falls hopelessly rn
love with her. On the brink of despair, he publicly declares his love
for her on the square of the village, but she directs hers to the local
schoolteacher, Bernard (Hippolyte Girardot). One day, the entire vil-
lage wakes up without water. No one knows that Manon has clogged
the spring in order to avenge her father's death. During a gathering in
the village shortly after, Manon accuses Cdsar and Ugolin of her
farher's death and reveals their stratagem. Cdsar denies the accusation,
but Ugolin, first driven by ambition, then rorn apart with remorse and
love, publicly accepts lhe guilt and associates it rvirh his love for her.
Destroyed by her refusal and his guilt, Ugolin commits suicide the
nexr day, hanging himself on a rree. As for Cdsar, he too no lotrger
wishes to live, but before he passes away, one of the village patriarchs
recounts the story of Florette, rhe young girl he was in love wirh in
his youth. C6sar then understands that the child she gave birth ro,
while he was in Africa, was the hunchback boy. Manon and Bernard,
nor. her husband, unblock rhe spring. Prosperiry comes anew.

Berri's main ambition was not to narrate a sequence of melodramauc
episodes. Since most of the morives were disclosed early on, rhe out-
come of Jean de Florette's fateful destiny appears quite predicrable.
Berri also did not intend ro creare a suspenseful plor devoid ofany real
psychological element, but rather to incorporate the ruthlessness of
human voracity: the land and waref are commodities worth dying for.
The calculated pace of the multilayered and pervasive murder story
emphasizes the abomination of the characters' wroogdoing. These two
epic thrillers, shot but rhree months apart and rotaling nine months
of shooting, not only met with considerable success in the Unired
States but also conlirmed Claude Berri as one of rhe most talented
producer-lilmmakers in France.

Fot actor Daniel Auteuil (b. r95o), the collaboration with Claude
Berri represented a decisive turning point in the actor's career, one of
the premier examples of a sudden career takeoff in French cinema
hisrory. In t975, G€rard Pirbs assigned him a supporting role to
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Emmanuelle B6art (lfaoon) in Claude Bertr's Mawn of the Spring (Maun det nattet'

r986), (Courtesy of BIFI/O Reon Productions).
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Claude Brasseur, Catherine Deneuve, and Jean-Louis Trintignant ln
Ax of Agrerian (L'Agrutiox)- Be{ore Jean de Florette, Auteuil was consid-
ered the archetypal B-picture actor, working in CIande Zidi's B1tes nais
dirciplix[t in r979, and later Les sous-douds in r98o and Charles Nemes's
Les b6rcs n'ant pas ftoitl aux oreilles in 1978. Virtually no film critic
could ever have imagined rhat the rest of his film career, following the
stccess o{ Jean de Florun, would include illustrious awards such as the
Cdsars for Best Actor in Manon of the Spring in t987, and Patnce
Leconte's The Gid on tbe Bridge (La f.lle nr le poxt in 1999)_ Interest-
ingly, Auteuil gave up a part in Coline Seteau's Three Men and a
Craclle to play the role of the unattractive Ugolin, which secured him
the C6sar. From then on, Auteuil's roles have been a long series of
successful choices, including work in Michel Deville's i paltoquer
(1986), and Claude Sautet's Quelqua jour: atvc mai (rc;88) atd A Heart
in lYintu (Un near en hiter. t99z). His participation on the stage was
also crowned by success with MoliEre's Les fourberies de Scapin at the
Fesrival d'Avignon and at the Th6Atre Mogador during the r99o-9r
season. As the years went by, Auteuil endorsed even more serious roles
in Andr6 T6chin6's My Far:orite Seasan (Ma :aisan lrifdr{e. 1993), Tbeue:
(l-es ualeurs, 1995), Coline Setreau's Romuald and Juliete (1989), a
convincing Henri IV in Patrice Ch6reau's Queen M"rgot (La reine Mar-
glt, 1991), Berrl's Lucie Aulrac, ard Jaco Van Dormael's The Eigbth
Day (Le huitiiue jour, ry96)-for which he received the Prix
d'interpr€tarion at the Cannes Film Fesrival, shared with Pascal Du-
quenne, his young Down syndrome costar. Despite a rather "delayed"
career revelarion thar did nor occur until his mid-thirties, the magnr-
tude of Auteuil's accomplishments promoted him as one of the most
artistic and multitalented actors of his generarion. The key ro Daniel
Auteuil's rriumphs may actually be his uncommon maturity, which
allowed him ro endorse challenging performances with rare sensitiviry
ancl eloquence.

The series Jean dz Florette and Manon of the Spring was also the
springboard for Emmanuelle B6an (b. r963). Daughter of the famous
songwriter and singer Guy B6art, the actress mostly appeared in mrnor
roles, primarily on TV, until being cast as a ca.ll girl in Edouard
Molinaro's Date witb an Angel (L'amour en douce, t 985). Although only
present in the sequel Manrn of tbe Spring, the intensity of her perfor-
mance impressed the French cinema academy ro such a degree rhat she
received two awards, Best Supporting Role and Best New Talent, for
her work in the film. Like Daniel Auteuil, whom she married shortly
thereafter, Emmanuelle B6art expanded her career on screen as well as
on the theatrica.l srage (Marivaux's La daable incanstame in 1988 and
Molitsre's Le xtiunt/trope wrth actor Jacques Veber in 1989). Her most
recenr pictures are Claude Sauret's Ne//1 and Mr. Amaud (Ne1ly et
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Daniel Auteuil (Ugolin) in Claude Berri s Maxan af the Sqring (Manan d.r 't'are!,
r986), (Courtesy of BIFIr'@ Renn Productions).

llonsieur Arnaad, r995), Brian De Palma's Mit:ion: lmpouible (t996),

DaniEle Thornpson's La Bdcbe (I'a bfrche, 1999), Olivier Assayas's ler

destindes (La dettinies rcntimentale\ zooo), and FtanEois Ozon's Hait

femmes (zooz) .
Along wirh Claude Berri, ditector Jean-Jacques Annaud must be

regarded as a filmmaker dedicated ro an international market, as he
has often described himself as a "French man" who makes movies and

not a "French filmmaker." Born in 1943, Annaud came to film via a
srrong adverrising background from the r97os. A graduate of the
national fillo:, school, the Ecole de Vaugirard, he achieved his first short
fearure at age nineteen with LeJ rept plch4r capitaux du cixiaste. He later

obtained a licence de lettres, which allowed him to enter the presti-
gious IDHEC, Annaud practiced his artistic alents rn Paris-Match and

TV commercials (more than 4oo spots). After his first fullJength

feature film in t916, Black axd'{/hite it Calor (l-a tidure I chartant),

a satire of the colonial period that did not do well at the box office
(despite its Oscar for Best Foreign Film/Ivory Coast), his name began
to be associated with the promising expectations of new French ditec-

tors. Although rather mediocre, Clu! de ftte (1979), his second film,

was another srep toward "cinematographic consecration." But it rvas

only with Ques far Fire (La gaet're cla feu, tgSt), an enormous commer-
cial success, that Annaud met $'ith international fame. The Anglo-
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Canadian production, whose total cosr reached $rz million, gathered
international acrors such as Everett McGill, Ron Perlman, Namir El
Kadi Gaw, Rae Dawn Chong, and Gary Schwartz, and won C6sars for
Best Film and Best Director in t982.

Qaat fnr Fire was the real breakthrough for Annaud; the film has
defined his style ever since. Adapted from Joseph-Henri Rosny's rgrr
novel,'e the film is an allegorical tale narraring a tribal struggle for
survival after its only source of fire has died. The tribe members know
how to preserve it and spread it but not how ro re-creare it. Some ofthe
tribe are sent on an expedition to discover the secrer offire. The srory
begins with the vicissitudes of three Homo sapiens in search of fire,
which ultimarely gives power to their rribe. Fire is not only a fearful
weapon but a symbol of evolurionary superiority. Despite the unusual
deploy of technical means for a French direcror, Annaud took the crew
on a "similar" expedition around rhe globe as they began shooring in
Kenya in r98o, Scotland, and ultimately in Canada in r98 r.r '

Five years later, Annaud successfully adapted the difficult novel Z/e
Name of tbe Rose (Le nam de /a rase, t986), wrimen by the kalian novelist
and semiologist Umbetto Eco. \Vith a budger of $r7 million, a
Franco-Italian-German coproduction team, and three years of plan-
ning, rhe film also took four screenwriters attempting to master Eco's
novel.r' These medieval chronicles, beautifully photographed by crne-
matographer Tonino delli Colli, fully came to life, eventually winning
the C6sat for Best Foreign Film in 1987. This psychological thriller
rerraces the memoir of Adso of Melk (Christian Slater) and his visic in
r3z7 with his masrer, the Franciscan monk \:Villiam of Baskerville
(Sean Connery), to a Benedicrine abbey in northern Italy. Outside rts
walls, starving peasants battle for leftovers thrown down from the
monks' kitchens. \Tilliam is sent to investigate the mysterious death
of one of the monks. Despite the silence and oddity of many of them,
he rnakes measured but effective progress. Flowever, while the inves-
tigation continues, a second murder occurs. \7i11iam is convinced that
the key to the mystery, which will lead to the true murderer, resides
inside the scriptorium of the main library, at the pinnacle of which
stands a great tower arranged as a labyrinth. Brother Berenger (Michael
Habeck), now the third assassinated monk, is found drowned in a wine
barrel with once more a recurrent panicularity: a black spot on one of
his forefingers as well as on his tongue. The progress of the investrga-
tion is hampered by the arrival of Bernardo Gui (Murray Abraham),
an officer of the Holy Inquisition, who immediately condemns several
suspicious monks to be put on trial. Meanwhile, Villiam discovers the
source of all the deaths a translation of Aristotle's Poetict, a forEidden
manuscript in medieval times, which defines the importance of human
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laughter. An old monk, Jorge de Burgos (Feodor Chaliapin), placed
poison in the corner of each page, thereby indirecrly killing anyone
who dared to read the blasphemous book. Once trapped, the old monk
sets the tower on fire and dies in rhe flames. \(/illiam has just enough
rime to exit alive. Meanwhile, the peasants gathered around the gal-
lows start an upheaval, which ends in the death of the inquisitor.

Despite his international fame and contribution to world cinerna,
many French film critics tend to sysrematically categorize Annaud's
movies exclusively as part of rhe French-film legacy. To this, Annaud
usually answers by asserting his internarional endorsement, whether
frnancially or arristically, by the very makeup of his casc of actors and
technical crews. Annaud wrote rhe scenario of most of his films with
the collaboration of G6rard Brach3' (b, r92"/), and the scores vr'ere by
various French artists. In an interview with cultural attach6 Laurent
Danidlou, Annaud spoke of his philosophy regarding national cinema:

I think that one should not identi{' the nationality of a film q'ith its
language, as if it were literature. The art of 6lm couesponds to the art
of the image, and. langLrage is a secondary issue. When a French novel
becomes an international success, it is because it conveys the thoughts
of the French authot and not his language. For 6lms, it is the same."

Thus, Annaud explained his decision to work in the United States.
\Wirh the regulations imposed on French directors working in France,
Annaud preferred to keep his artistic freedom even if this meant
working abroad. Annaud is fond of mentioning ro the international
press that all of his fi.lms have been financed in different countries
(e.g., The Nann of tbe Rore was financed by American, German, ftalian,
and French backers).

This ls a good occasion to change mentalities and to explain to the
French that Americans are not trying ro kill French cinema. They ate
just businessmen whose goal is to make good movies.... Ve, profes-
sionals, think that q.ith the American community, French people get
the wrong idea about what is going on in Los Angeles. It is a much
frieodlier world and open to foreign infuences than one thinks.'ife ate
here to help our French colleagues to understand the evolution of
Hollywood cinema and to allow Americans to get acquainted with
French technicians. The goal is to help contacts and eventually to create
a friendly climare between the two communiries.r4

In r99r, Claude Berri offered Annaud the complex adapration of
Matguerite Duras's best-seller Tbe Lorcr (,L'antant), which proved to be
a box of6ce and critical success. Also successful at the box offce was
Swen Years in Tibet (Sept au ak T;bet, u)97), which took its inspiration
from the autobiographical srory of Heinrich Flarrer, a war prisoner
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Jean-Jacques Annaud and Sean Connery during the shoot;og ofTre Naile ofthe Roie
(l+ non de la rose, 1986), (Courtesy of BIFI).

held by the British in India during !(/orld War II, who escaped
through the Himalayas and settled in Tibet, eventually becoming the

Freceptor of the Dalai Lama. Annaud's most-recent hlm, Envny at the
G.treJ (Stttlhgral), depicting the Eastern fronr in epic scope rhrough
the character of the Russian sniper Vassili Zaitsev (interpreted by the
rising British movie star Jude Law), was released in rhe United States
in March zoo r.

NEIJT DIRECTORS FOR A NE'W GENERATION:
JEAN-JACQUES BEINEIX AND LUC BESSON

As film historian Ren6 Pr6dal once observed, "After the cinema on
weddings (the r95os), the erotic cinema (r96os), cinema on sex
(r97os), the cinema of the rgSos speaks about love as Beineix, Besson
and Carax emphasize the comeback of the couple, fcilowtng the libet-
tinage of the New I7ave and the sexual fteedom of the following
generation."r' The new generation of young lilmmakers was early

1:l
: . t '
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characterized by the innovative style ofJean-Jacques Beineix. Beinerx

began his careet as first assistant to filmmakers Claude Zidi and Claude

Berri, His lirst feature-length frln, Diua (Diaa, r98t), can be consid-
ered both an auteur film and a commercial thriller. After a catastrophic

debut in March r98r, due to slow attendance and some bad press by

unenthusiastic critics, the lilm took off slowly. The success of Dfua n

rhe US allowed a commercial second chance in France, as it took four

Cdsars the next year (Best First Feature, Best Music Score, Best Pho-

tography, Best Sound), consequently becoming an exceptionally fash-

ionable movie-
Adapted from Delacorta's novd,, Dita flarrates the tranquil existence

of young moped postman Jules (Fr6ddric Andrei), who, passionate for

opera, declares an infinire admiration for his idol, the American oPera

star Cynthia Hawkins (Wilhelmenia lTiggins Fernandez). During one

of her rare recirals in Paris, he records her live performance with a tape

recorder surreptitiously placed on his lap. To make matrers worse, he

steals one of her dresses while wairing for an aatograph backstage.
Although universally celebrated, Cynthia Hawkins has refused to be-

come a recording artist. Therefore, any pirated recording becomes
priceless on rhe black market. A second story, so far unrelared to the

previous one, concerns the murder of a prostitute by two hit men, who
before dying leaves in Jules's motorcycle bag a compromising tape-
recorded confession that will help indict a drug ringleader and head of
the prostitution netrvork, who also happens to be one of the chief
officers in the police force, Saporta Qacques Fabbri). Later, Jules meets
Alba (Thuy An Luu), a young Asian gid, who, also interested in opera,
asks to listen !o his secret recording, Overcome by guilt, -lules decides

ro take the dress back to Cynthia. A friendship begins, as well as a
platonic-love relationship. The tape Jules possesses of rhe diva's finest

performance falls into the mob's hands, and soon they threaten to

release major bootleg copies of it unless Cynthia signs exclusively with
them. Meanwhile, Sapotta and his hit men are after Jules to find the

cassette left by the prostitute. On the brink of being killed, Jules rs
saved by Gorodish (Richard Bohringer), who takes him away to Nor-
mandy. In a suspenseful finale, Gorodish invites both parties (the Asian
gangsters and Saporta) to recoup their long-awaited prize.

The action scenes, including a remarkable chase through the Paris

Merro, are powerfully contrasted with the languorous setting of Gar-
adish's immense apafiment as well as Jules and Cynthia's romantic
walk through the park. This new type of visual contrast, so character-
istic of the late r98os, with its strong visual aesthetics, colors, and

conflicting tones! contributed to Ditta's reputarion as a breakthrough
film, Philippe Rousselot's cinematography'6 accounts for the numerous
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visual effects, in particular the film's stylized noidike sense, an amal-
gamation of a significant emotional background with idiosyncraric
personages like Jules. Constantly finding himself navigating worlds
whose borders appear prohibitive and mysterious to him, Jules rs
relentelessly chased by the police, the mob, record companies, and
ultimately his own conscience. The result is an effective enterprise of
assimilation of the Romanesque element with the visual. 'With some
innovative cinemarography and direction, and the acrion becoming
increasingly freneric but at the same rime always under control,
Beineix was able to challenge the conventional rhythms of rhe rhriller.
A model of pacing for some, while too slow for others, the film, with
its complicated plot, survives without falling prey to the usual dam-
agingly excessive levels of exposition. Vladimir Cosma's score and, of
course, \Tilhelmenia !(iggins Fernandez's voice anchored the film,
giving it an extrasensory element that sepantes Diua from the run-of-
the-mill light rhriller or melodrama.

Spurred to renew his successful, and by then widely praised creativ-
ity, Beineix's next attempt was a clear commercial failure. Disapproved
by rhe critics and ignored by disenchanted audiences, The Moox in tbe
Guxer (.1,a lune dans Ie caniueau, 1983) surprised viewers with its tone
and format. \(ith some of the biggest names in European cinema
(Nastassja Kinski, G6rard Depardieu, and Victoria Abril, among oth-
ers), the film does not really succeed in capturing the mood of the
times despite the impressive sets of Hilton McConnico (winner of the
1984 C6sar for Best Set). However, rt was Betty Blue (37,2o le rnatin,
1986) that conlirmed the expectations of this promising filmmaker.
Beineix decided to produce this 6lm himself on a more modest budget.
Adapted from Philippe Djian's novel, rhe srory takes place in the south
of France and centers on the relationship between Zorg Qean-Hugues
Anglade),r'a young handyman who lives in a beach house, and his
girlfriend, Betty (Bdatrice Dalle). Painting houses by day and making
love by night, the couple seem to live a fullilled and hedonistic
existence. One day, Betty clashes with Zorg's boss, violently insulting
him before burning down several of his beach cotrages. Zorg then loses
his job. They now both work at Eddy's (Gdrard Darmon) pizzeria. One
day, Berty discovers a manuscript written by Zorg. She comes ro
believe that he is a great writer and spends hours typing the manu-
script, then mailing it to several publishers. Following a string of
rejections, Betty loses het confidence. Larer, rhe couple move into an
old house in a small village, where Zorg finds a job as a piano salesman.
The story turns tragic when Betty lapses into schizophrenia. \X/hile

hoping to become pregnanr, she becomes depressed and ultimately goes
mad. Following a suicide attempr, she is sent to an asylum while in a
coma. Compassionate and desperate himself, Zorg decides to soothe her
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pain by choking her to death. The outcome of free-spiritedness is not
uplifting success but madness, self-destruction, and ultimately death.

Beineix's primary goal for the film was to show the exrraordinary
relationship of this srruggling couple from a compassionate perspec-
tive. lTithout being overbearing, the lilm succeeds in portraying the
simple motivations of young people amid the obstacles of a compli-
cated wodd. The direcror's visual talents (colorful style, spectacular
crane shots, sliding camera movements) are combined with the fantas-
ric photography and the tragic story line: "I had known Betty for a
week. The forecast was for storms," reminds viewers of the implicir
narrator in an eady scene. Much like Diua, the lilm captured the mood
and the sequential tensions as well as underscored the plot's inherent
sexuality and absolute visual effervescence. Beineix's characters are
creatures of pure will, given to ostentatious romantic obsessions, (Berty

wanders wirhout focus for her deep emotional energy.) Though the
story was nor atypical, it was already the expression of a new cinemat-
ographic trend. In its extraordinary narrative element, Bettl Blue can
come across as being both analytical and "swept away" in equal mea-
sure, and here the desolate poetry of Beineix's mise-en-scEne is both
unique and fully realized-

The other grear revelation of the r98os was director Luc Besson
who experienced his lirst commercial success in t984, with Subual.
Born in Paris in 1959, Luc Besson grew up by the ocean, where his
parenrs were diving instructors for the famous CIub M6diterrande.
After a brief stay in Hollywood, he rerurned to France, where he began
ro produce shorts, His 6rst experiences were as an assistant in Lewis
Gtlbert's Moanraker (r979) and in Maurice Pialat's Lc,uloa (t98o). \(in-
ner of the Avoriaz International Film Festival. Le dsnier cottbat (made

in r983, with a budget of 17 mill ion francs) gave Besson rhe l inancial
secutity he crucially needed to convince filture producers. This success
allowed him to win prestigious assignments, such as Isabelle Adjani's
video "Pull marine" (music by Serge Gainsbourg) and some ad spors
for the Dim brand. First perceived as neo-New \i/ave, Besson's so-
called young cinema typically represents a heavily graphic world de-
humanized by money and power, where the flight of human
imagination and realism meet in a choked-up, overpoweringly oppres-
sive environment. Vith the collaboration of Pierre Jolivet, Besson
wrote the script fof Subway, a film that was knocked by film crirics for
its lack of "real" characters. The public, on the other hand, not only
ensured the success of the 6lm but was also indirectly responsible for
the C6sar Awards in 1986 for Best Actor (Christophe Lambert), Best
Set (Alexandre Trauner), and Best Sound (Harald Maury, luc P6rini,
and G6rard Lamps).

Largely confined to the Paris Metro, the story narrates the viclssr-
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tudes of Fred (Christophe I-ambert), an eccentric young man, who
meets Helena (Isabelle Adjani) in the strange wodd of the Parisian
subway. Besson explores the compositional alternatives for his wild,
bright-yellow spiky punk haircut personage who, after stealing some
compromising documents from Helena's husband in his residence,
takes re6:ge from his pu$uers, ber husband's thugs, in the Paris
underground. Bored by her life of wealth, Helena agrees to meet him.
Fred demands a ransom in exchange for the documents, but what he
secretly desires is to see Flelena again. Fred does not give her the
documents immediately. Helena, with the assistance of a police inspec-
tor, and her husband's private militia all chase him. Nevertheless, as
the manhunt intensifies, Helena experiences a change of heart. The
combination of visual "punk," intensely drawn actors from the mean
streets, and rhe mesmerizing beauty of Isabelle Adjani epitomize a sort
of postmodern fusion of frames of reference that ultimately gives the
lilm a Surreal, cinematic dimension. For the general movie public this
specialized segment is enchanting, as the film possesses a fac-
tual plot and an execution that is so neo-romanric as to approach
visual opulence.

After the suffocating universe of the Parisian subway, Besson moved
on to his next project, this rime embraciog the world he knew best,
that of the ocean. The Big Blue (Le grand blea, rg88) is considered one
of the most signifrcant cult movies of the r98os, a true manifesto of
youth. Besson presented a compelling meditation on the fascinating
spell that the Sreat oceans cast on humans (Besson himself once aspired
to be a marine biologist).

The story begins with the childhood of two friends, Jacques Mayol
(Jean-Marc Barr) and boisterous and cocky Enzo Molinari (Jean R6no),
who share a passion for snorkeling. The friends spend wonderfiul mo-
ments during makeshift-diving competitions as they challenge each
other to see who can sray underwater the longesr, braving danger and
possibly death. Obsessed with the idea of outdoing each orher, the
boys spur each other on to more daring feats of physical skill. But one
day tragedy srikes as Jacques's father, an experienced diver, dies at sea.
As an adult, Jacques still keeps in mind rhis tragic accident. Johanna
(Rosanna Arquette), an American insurance claims adjuster, sees

Jacques diving in a frozen Peruvian lake and imrnediately falls in love
with him. She then follows him from New York to Europe ro pursue
a difficult romance (Besson ultimately sets up the real competitron;

Johanna versus the dolphins). \7hat the young F.oman does not antic-
ipate is the hypnotic enchantment rhe ocean has on Jacques and the
way it incessantly appears ro pull him deeper and deeper. Enzo, who
has not seen Jacques for twenty years, is by now a world-class dtver
but is still haunted by knowing there is indeed someone out there
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Isabelle Adjani (Helena) in Luc Besson's Subwal (Stbua1, r984), (Courtesy ofBIFI/

O Gaumont).
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berter than he. During the wodd free-diving competition in Taormina,
Sicily, borh companions set wodd records that no competing divers
can break. For his part, Jacques desires to pur behind him the memory
of his father's loss and earn Enzo's respect ar a sporr they have been
playing for years. The contest between Jacques and Enzo keeps inten-
sifying, rvith the two driving the orher farther down ro rhe d€pths of
the sea. Although changed with time, their friendship remains strong
until one day Enzo, surpassing his own limit in a dive, dies in the
arms of Jacques when he returns to the surface. Distressed by Enzo's
last request to leave his body at the bottom of the ocean, Jacques
becomes depressed until the day he decides to dive for eternity. Once
at the bottom of the sea, surrounded by the blueness, he slowly and
silently lets go. Vith his cinematic storytelling style, Besson pondered
the cosmos rhrough his free-divingrs hero Jacques Mayol,re a world-
record holder, who stood at the center of rhe project. The role of

Jacques was actually first offered to Christopher Lambert, Mickey
Rourke, and Mel Gibson, before going to Jean-Marc Barr.a"

Despite the apparent simplicity of the screenplay and the sagacrty
of the dialogue (rhe lack of complexity in the characters was unex-
pected), Besson, who is not considered a master storyteller, succeeded
by virtue of his highly stylized use of imagery and his underwarer
scenes (.Tbe Big Blue oozed with a sensuous beauty unlike any other
lilm at the timel. The Big Blue was nonerheless intriguing, with the
originaliry of its photography (by Carlo Varini) of Mediterranean wa-
ters. Eric Setra's score (Galden Eje, Tbe F ifth Eletnent) captured the
director's ambirions rvith its pre-New Age music. In rhe American
format, containing a drastically revised "happy" ending, a separate
music scote replaced the original sound track (by composer Bill Conti).
The images and the music brilliantly intermingled as the eye of
rhe camera plunged into rhe deep, generating a visual blend rhar
could not be separated: vibrant hues and sound seem to glow off
the screen.

Although French 6lm directors and critics ofren address the hot-
button issue of the "maievolent" Hollywood influence on their nation's
cinemarographic ethos, Luc Besson can be most accurarely described as
one of the Gw French filmmakers who has set out ro comoete head to
head with heavyweighrs such as George Lucas and S.e,r'en SpieLb..g.
But Besson's sryle also corresponds to a visual challenge that ultimately
reevaluates the criteria of appreciation and visual coherence. In facr,
Besson's main cinematographic force is his ability to caFrure the mo-
ment in vibrant images, to create a beautiful tapestry of emotions and
sights. Distinctly un-European, Besson's productions are generally di-
rected to the broad American public, yet they have still mostly prcr-
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Roland Giraud (Pierre), Michel Boujenah (Michel), aod Andr6 Dussollier {acques)
in Colioe Serreau's 7/ree \len and a Cutlle (Trai honnes et an coa/fz), r 985 (Courtesy

of BIFI/O Flachlilms).
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voked a lack of sympathy on the part of American oitics and much
apathy from other overseas moviegoers.

The shooting of The Big Blxe took more than nine months, in Italy,
Greece, the Virgin Islands, the United States, and Peru. One of the
malor problems in post-production was cutting the zoo-minute fi lm
to r3z minutes. (A r68-minute director's cut was released in the US
market twelve years later.) First screened at the 1988 Cannes Film
Festival, the film went on to garner seven nominations for C6sars,
winning the award for Best Music Score (Eric Serra). Despite a certain
disappointment rvhen compared to Jean-Jacques Annaud's Tbe Bear
and Bruno Nuytten's Canille Clauclel,l'the film's popular success in
France and distribution in the United Stares remained a rare example
of a pb{roraine dt vcidt6. Ltc Besson's career conrinued to flourish with
La Feurne Nihita (Nikita, tgclo), Tbe Profestional (L6on, 1994,The Firth
Eletwxt (Le dnqaiime il€neat, 1991), and Tbe Maserger: The Story af Jaan
of Arc (leanne d'Atc, tc199).

THE REBIRTH OF POPULAR COMEDIES: COLINE
SERREAU AND CLAUDE ZIDI

The cafl+hditre phenomenon, born outside the world of stand-up
comedy at the end ofthe r96os, evolved into a ne$' type of comidies
dz boaletard, or popular comedy, a decade later. The r98os thrived
on its legacy and promoted the performance of irs actors-aside from
the predominanr humor instigated by Coluche with such films as
Michel Blanc's Marche ) I'ambre (1984) and G6rard Jugnot's Pinot stm-
ph Jlic (tcs8f.

Against all expectations, the greatest comedy success of the r98os,
as well as the 6fth biggest commercial hit ever, came from an almost-
unknown female director, Coline Serreau (b. rs+z), with Tbree Men
and a Cradle (Trais brntnet et un coffir, r 985). The film, a persuasive
testimony to the change in mentality which occurred in the r98os,
was produced during a sociological evolution toward a more liberal
and progressive society. Three single men, Pierre (Roland Giraud),
egomaniacal Jacques (Andr€ Dussollier), and Nlichel (Michel Bou-
jenah), live a life of leisure in their luxurious apartment. One tule
prevails: women are strictly forbidden. Jacques, an Air France flight
attendant, accepts an unknown package the day he must leave for Asia,
One Sunday, Pierre and Michel lind a cradle in fiont of their door, a
basket with an infant gid Marie, and a letter from rhe baby's mother,
Sylvia (Philippine Leroy Beaulieu), Jacques's ex-girlfriend- The note
says she must go to the United States and wants Jacques to take care
of the infant for "just" six months. Life for the bachelors is immedi-
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ately and drastically changed. In a series of comic scenes, they Iearn

about baby formulas and diapers. After three weeks, Jacques finally
comes home, and the three men become Marie's three dads. Vhen
Sylvia returns to take Marie away, the men feel an immense relief rhat
is soon followed by an inexplicable void in theit lives. The finale is
quite unexpected, as Sylvia, a professional model, asks her companions
to help rear the child, since her professional career cannot allow her
the time. The scripr, which tracks the men's relationship with the
baby, explores the hidden desire for fatherhood from men who typi-
cally ar.oid making commitments. This American-sryle comedy al-
though generared on a small budget won an impressive series of
awards: C6sars for Best Film, Best Scenario, and Best Supporting Role
(Michel Boujenah). The American remake. leonard Nimoy'sThr* Mm
and a Bafu, shot in 1987 (with Tom Selleck, Ted Danson, and Steve
Guttenberg), was also successful at the American box office.

Also widely acclaimed as one of the best comedies of all time was
M! Nelr Partner (Lu ripoux, 1985) by Claude Zidi (b. 1934). Never
before had a mainstrearn comedy been rewarded so handsomely at the
French Academy Awards as this one was in 1985. Nfith C6sars for
Best Film, Best Director, and Best Montage (Nicole Saunier), M1 Araa,
Partner co[frrmed the rehabilitation of comedy among general audi-
ences as well as 61m critics. Zidi's idea came from a meeting with a
young police officer during the 1982 Cannes Film Festival. From a
series of authentic anecdotes, Zidi developed the plot into a full-lengrh
feature 6lm (the title, Les ripoux, is French slang for "crooked cops").
The story is a confrontation t'etween two schools in rhe Parisian police
force. Corruption in M1 Neta Pattner seems to be the natural state of
law eniorcement.

Ren6 (Philippe Noiret), a police inspector who rhrives on fraudulent
kickbacks and racketeering, is joined by a young newcomer, FranEois
(Thierty Lhermitte), who arrives straight from the police academy. The
movie is primarily about the process of the conscientious, law-abiding
officer and his "reeducation" under Ren6. Ren6 has a hard rime associ-
ating with his new partner since FranEois disapproves of all his corrupt
methods. Hoping to win FranEois's loyalty, Ren6's companion (R6gine)

linds a friend, Natacha (Grace De Capitani), an attractive call girl, who
succeeds at least in changing his look. Both police officers enter a
wodd of corruption as they get involved in drug trafficking. Ulti-
mately Fnngois pulls ir off, but not Ren6.

Zidi is known for mainstream burlesque comedies and standard-
bearers of Sunday cinema (purely commercial French cinema that nof-
mally never crosses the Atlantic). My Neut Partner was his first national
commercial success. Except for Tbree Men axd a Cradle, rarely has a
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comedy managed to win the best lilm award at rhe C€sars. The success
of AIy Netu Parnzt triggered a no less successful sequel in r99a, Ripaux
ca tre Ripllrx. Other films from Claude Zidi include Tbe Ving or the
Thigh. Ingutor La Baaure, Tbe Jackpot! (La Totale!, r99r), which in-
spired James Cameron's Trae Liet (1994), and Asterix and Obelix u;.
Cdctar (Artdrix et Obdlix cantre Cdtar, r999).


